Meeting Date: 05/24/16 Agenda item \5’

REQUESTED COMMISSION ACTION:
X Consent Ordinance _ Resolution Consideration/Discussion Presentation

SHORT TITLE Approval to replace tornado-damaged fencing at various locations for the Public Works

Department, from Bauer Construction, per Broward County Contract #X1133902B1, at a

total cost of $31,614.90.

Summary of Purpose and Why:

The Public Works Department requests approval to replace tornado-damaged fencing, at various locations,
from Bauer Construction Corp., the awarded bidder per Broward County Contract #X1133902B1: Fencing —
New, Repairs and Replacement Services. The Broward County contract, which is valid through January
13, 2017, is based on a competitive solicitation, and the City Code allows us to piggyback a contract of this
type. The total cost of the replacement fencing is $31,614.90. City Commission approval of this action is
requested.

(1) Origin of request for this action: staff
(2) Primary staff contact:: Robert A. McCaughan/Hal Beard 954 786-4097
(3) Expiration of contract, if applicable: see above

(4) Fiscal impact and source of funding:  $31,614.90 from budgeted funds in account

121-2153-521.46-10, Repair & Maintenance/Land, Building Improvements, subject to transfer of

funds from the general fund disaster recovery account.
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MEMORANDUM

Purchasing #16-076

May 18, 2016
To: Dennis W. Beach, City Manager
Through: Otis J. Thomas, General Services Director
From: Jeff English, Purchasing Agent

Subject: Approval to Piggyback Broward County #X1133902B1: Fencing — New,
Repairs and Replacement Services

The Public Works Department recommends the City issue a Purchase Order to Bauer
Construction Corp., to replace tornado-damaged fencing, at various locations. Bauer
Construction Corp. was awarded a contract for Fencing — New, Repairs and Replacement
Services by Broward County, which is valid through January 13, 2017. The agreement is
based on a competitive solicitation, and the City Code allows us to piggyback a contract of
this type. Bauer Construction Corp. has quoted the City in accordance with the Broward
County contract. The fencing replacements will be purchased from account 121-2153-
521.46-10, Repair & Maintenance/Land, Building Improvements. Total cost is $31,614.90.

It is recommended that the Commission approve the purchase of fencing replacements,
per Broward County #X1133902B1, from Bauer Construction Corp. Please see copies of
the memorandum from the Public Works department, vendor’s quotation, and applicable
Broward County contract information, attached.

lie
enclosures

cc: file
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Florida’'s Warmest Welcome

Memorandum

To: Otis Thomas, General Services Director

From: Hal Beard, Assistant Public Works Director Z ‘.

/ V&
Cc: Robert McCaughan, Public Works Director ‘;*\’{‘\
Subject: Piggyback Broward County contract #X1133902B1 Fencing — New, Repairs and Replacement Services
Date: May 18, 2016

Bauer Construction Corporation is an approved fencing contractor for the Broward County contract #X1133902B1
and has provided a quote to repair fencing at various locations due to tornado damage as follows:

Fences, Chain-link fence, (POMPANO AIR PARK)
New 122 If of 7" high green chain-link with 1 - 10" drive gate.
Fences, Chain-link fence, (POOL ENCLOSURE)
New 280 If of green privacy screen.
Fences, Chain-link fence, (POOL ENCLOSURE)
New 130 If of 8 high black chain-link fence core-drilled into surface.
Fences, Chain-link fence, replace, 10' (TENNIS COURTS)
Repair 90 If of Black 10" high chain-link fence. 50 If of new black wire fabric.
Fences, Ornamental iron fence, Ornamental iron fence 48" high NOVELTY PARK)
New 40 If of black Wrought Iron Fence powder coated black.

The Public Works Department is proposing to replace fencing at various locations due to the tornado damage that occurred
on February 16, 2016. Bauer Construction Corporation has quoted a complete turnkey replacement of damaged fencing
based on the Broward County Contract #X1133902B1 Fencing — New, Repairs and Replacement Services in the amount of
$31,614.90. The Building Maintenance Division would like to proceed with a piggyback purchase from the Broward County
contract to purchase fencing replacement and repairs at various locations throughout the City.

Procurement Background:

Broward County solicited bids and effective January 14, 2014 approved Bauer Construction Corporation as one of the
awarded fencing contractors for the county for a three (3) year period ending on January 13, 2017.

Recommendation:

Public Works Department recommends approving the piggyback purchase from the Broward County Contract
#X1133902B1 Fencing — New, Repairs and Replacement Services to replace fencing at various locations in the amount of
$31,614.90. Funding is provided from Account No. 121-2153-521.46-10 Repair & Maintenance / Land, Bldgs.,
Improvements.

Cc: Roger Palermo, Building Maintenance Manager
File



BAUER CONSTRUCTION CORPORATION
Tte Fence Specialisr
1812 NE 22nd Terrace Ft. Lauderdale, FL 33305
(954) 760-9644 Fax (954) 760-9527
Dhuntershauer@aol.com
PROJECT PROPOSAL # 1804915806
Cust: Broward County - Pompano Beach Date:  April 24, 2016

Project: Novelty Park

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE Ea. EXT. PRICE
1 Pay ltem # 21: Misc. Field Fencing & Gate Repair (Per HR) 15.00 HR $50.00 $750.00
2 Pay ltem # 84: Centurion - Steel Rail 40.00 LF $47.00 $1,880.00

Pay item #21 includes hand setting, hand digging,
upgrade to 1" pickets, and acorn caps.

$2,630.00
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BAUER CONSTRUCTION CORPORATION
The Fence Specialiot
1812 NE 22nd Terrace Ft. Lauderdale, FL 33305
(954) 760-9644 Fax (954) 760-9527

Dhuntersbauer@aol.com
PROJECT PROPOSAL # 18046528966
Cust: Broward County - Pompano Beach Date:  April 20, 2016

Project:  Mitchell Moore Swimming Pool Fence

DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE Ea.
Pay Item # 4: 8' High Fencing 41000 LF $17.70
Pay item # 6; Corner Post with Double Brace for 8' 2.00 EA $300.00
Pay item # 17: Removal & Disposal of Existing Fencing 280.00 LF $3.00
Pay ltem # 21: Misc. Field Fencing & Gate Repair (Per HR) 73.00 HR $50.00
Pay ltem # 36: Center Rail Replacement 410.00 LF $2.70
Pay Item # 37: Bottom Rail Replacement 410.00 LF $2.90
Pay ltem # 46: V Coat of Fabric Post & Rails Black 4,100.00 SF $0.80

Pay item #21 includes removal of old posts and patch,
additional pasts for 8' centers, additional bivd clamps
and loop caps, repair spalled concrete, and furnish and
install 90 persent windscreen with center grommet strip
on North, West, and south fence, re install existing
windsreen where needed.

EXT. PRICE

$7,257.00

$600.00

$840.00
$3,650.00
$1,107.00
$1,189.00
$3,280.00

$17,923.00



ITEM

0 N OO O bd w N

BAUER CONSTRUCTION CORPORATION
Tthe Fence Specialior

1812 NE 22nd Terrace Ft. Lauderdale, FL 33305
(954) 760-9644 Fax (954) 760-9527

Dhuntersbauer@aol.com

PROJECT PROPOSAL # 1804629174

Cust: Broward County - Pompano Beach
Project: Mitchell Moore Tennis Court repairs

DESCRIPTION
Pay ltem # 1: 10" High Fencing
Pay ltem # 17: Removal & Disposal of Existing Fencing
Pay ltem # 21: Misc. Field Fencing & Gate Repair (Per HR)
Pay ltem # 29: Top Rail Replacement
Pay Item # 36: Center Rail Replacement
Pay ltem # 37: Bottom Rail Replacement
Pay ltem # 38: New Line Post for 10' Fence
Pay item # 46: V Coat of Fabric Post & Rails Black

Pay item #21 includes straightening damaged posts, re
tieing rails missing ties, and additional cost for tennis
court mesh.

QTY
S0.00
74.00
29.00
63.00
40.00
24.00

4.00
964.00

Date:

Aprif 20, 2016

UNIT PRICE Ea. EXT. PRICE

LF
LF
HR
LF
LF

$19.80 $1,782.00
$3.00 $222.00
$50.00 $1,450.00
$2.50 $157.50
$2.70 $108.00
$2.90 $69.60
$55.00 $220.00
$0.80 $771.20

$4,780.30
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BAUER CONSTRUCTION CORPORATION
The Fence Specialior
1812 NE 22nd Terrace Ft. Lauderdale, FL 33305
(954) 760-9644 Fax (954) 760-9527

Chuntersbauer@aol.com
PROJECT PROPOSAL # 1804630179
Cust: Broward County - Pompano Beach Date:  April 20, 2016

Project: Pompanoc Air Park

DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE Ea.
Pay ltem # 4: 8' High Fencing 148.00 LF $17.70
Pay item # 5: End Post with Single Brace for &' 3.00 EA $240.00
Pay ltem # 11: 28' Wide X 8' High Double Swing Gate 0.35 EA $2,100.00
Pay ltem # 14: V. Coat of Fabric Post & Rails Dark Green 1,580.00 SF $0.80
Pay ltem # 17: Removal & Disposal of Existing Fencing 74.00 LF $3.00
Pay item # 19: Rem. & Disp. of Existing 14’ Swing Gate 0.71 EA $100.00
Pay ltem # 21: Misc. Field Fencing & Gate Repair (Per HR) 13.00 HR $50.00

Pay item #11 includes 1-10' gate. Pay item #17 includes
removing blue fence and all posts. Pay item #21 includes
hand setting, hand digging, clean up of spoils, additiona!
cost for 6 gage vinyl fence to match existing.

EXT. PRICE

$2,612.60
$720.00
$735.00
$1,264.00
$222.00

$71.00

$650.00

$6,281.60



Bid No. X1133902B1

FENCING - NEW, REPAIRS AND REPLACEMENT SERVICES
Agency: Port Everglades Department

Purchasing Agent: Jeannette Ferrell

APPROVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS MEETING HELD JANUARY 14, 2014 AGENDA ITEM NO. 32

Date Bid Posted: 11/4/2013

Date Bid Opened:
Bid Submittals:

Declinations:

11/20/2013

BRIGWWARD

COUNTY

Purchasing Division
wiwvw broward.org/purchasing

Bauer Construction Corporation Gomez and Son Fence

Tabulation of Bids 1812 NE 22 Terrace 2304 NW 30 Court #2304

| Fort Lauderdale, FL 33305 Oakland Park, FL 33311

| tem “ C°B‘e";‘;‘:i';"’i§:de | Qty ‘ Unit | UnitPrice Total Price Unit Price Total Price

Group 1 (items 1 through 63A)
1 10’ High Fencing (Pave Area) 16,500| LF $19.80] $ 326,700.00 $17.50] $ 288,750.00
2 _|End Post with Single Brace for 10’ High Fence 63 EA $250.00} 15,750.00 $600.00] $ 37,800.00
3 __|Comer Post with Double Brace for 10’ High Fence 85 EA $330.00| $ 28,050.00 $600.00]| $ 51,000.00
4 |8 High Fence 34,000] LF $17.70| $ 601,800.00 $13.50 $ 459,000.00
5 |End Post with Single Brace for 8' High Fence 186 EA $240.00| $ 44,640.00 $500.00{ $ 93,000.00
6 _{Comer Post with Double Brace for 8' High Fence 210 EA $300.00| $ 63,000.00 $500.00| $ 105,000.00
7___|6' High Fencing 16,700 LF $15.00} $ 235,500.00 $11.50/ $ 180,550.00
8 |End post with Single Brace for 6' High Fence 83 EA $185.00| $ 15,355.00 $200.00| $ 16,600.00
9 [Comer post with Double Brace for 6’ High Fence 50 EA $245.00| $ 12,250.00 $200.00] $ 10,000.00
10 |28’ Wide x B' High Sliding Gate 33 EA $3,000.00| $ 99,000.00 $2,900.00{ $ 95,700.00
11|28’ Wide x 8' High Double Swing Gate 41 EA $2,100.00{ $ 86,100.00 $2,900.00| $ 118,800.00
12|28’ Wide x 6’ High Double Swing Gate 32 EA $1,750.00] $ 56,000.00 $1,300.00| $ 41,600.00
13 14’ Wide x 8 High Personnel Gate 73 EA $425.00| $ 31,025.00 $700.00| $ 51,100.00
14 _|Vinyl Coating of Fence Fabric Dark Green 3,000 SF $0.80| $ 2,400.00 $1.00{ $ 3,000.00
15__|Vinyl Coating of Fence Fabric Navy Blue 2,000 SF $0.80| $ 1,600.00 $1.25[ % 2,500.00
16 _|Relocation of Existing 8' High Fence 2,200 LF $5.00{ $ 11,000.00 $23.00] $ 50,600.00
17 |Removal and Disposal of Existing Fence 38,000| LF $3.00| § 114,000.00 $0.75] § 28,500.00
18 [Removal and Disposal of 4’ Pedestrian Gate 16 EA $15.00f $ 240.00 $5.00] $ 80.00
19 |Removal and Disposal of 14' Swing Gate 52 EA $100.00| § 5,200.00 $50.00{ $ 2,600.00
20 |Removal and Disposal of 28’ Slide Gate 20 EA $125.00{ $ 2,500.00 $70.00| $ 1,400.00
21 _|Miscellaneous Field Fencing and Gate Repair 1,400 HR $50.00[ $ 70,000.00 $100.001 $ 140,000.00
22 {Miscellaneous Welding Repairs including Consumables 450 HR $30.00[ $ 13,500.00 $80.00| $ 36,000.00
23 _|Relocating 4’ Pedestrian Gate (including New Gate Posts) 4 EA $90.00| § 360.00 $550.00| $ 2,200.00
24 |Relocating 14’ Swing Gate (including New Gate Posts) 14 EA $140.00{ § 1,960.00 $500.00] $ 7,000.00
25 |Relocating 28’ Slide Gate (including New Gate Posts) 32 EA $200.00] $ 6,400.00 $650.00] § 20,800.00
26 |PVC tubular Dark Green Slats 2500 | SF $2.00] $ 5,000.00 $2.00{ $ 5,000.00
27 _|Single 8’ High Swing Gate (15' to 207) 300 | LF $70.00] § 21,000.00 $150.00] § 45 000.00
28 |Single 8’ High K-Brace Gate (20 to 32") 560 LF $79.00( $ 44,240.00 $80.00| $ 44,800.00
29 [Top Rail Replacement 1,700 LF $2.50{ $ 4,250.00 $4.00] $ 6,800.00
30 |Sea Fan “A” 8' High 7 EA $650.00{ $ 4,550.00 $600,00{ $ 4,200.00
31 |SeaFan "B” 8 High 5 EA $100.00| § 500.00 $650.00 3,250.00
32 |Replacement Barbed Wire and Barbed Wire Arms 16,500 LF $1.50| $ 24,750.00 $2.50 41,250.00
33 [Replacement Line Posts 8' High 270 EA $45.00 $ 12,150.00 $80.00 21,600.00
34 _iBollards (5'-0" Above Existing Grade) 324 EA $210.00| $ 68,040.00 $280.00| $ 90,720.00
35 {Removal of Existing Bollards (0-1" to 10'-0") 32 EA $10.00] $ 320.00 $70.00]| $ 2,240.00
36 |Center Rail Reptacement 900 LF $2.70| $ 2,430.00 $3.50| § 3,150.00
37 |Boitom Rail Replacement 900 LF $2.90 $ 2,610.00 $3.50| § 3,150.00
38 |Line Posts 10’ High 140 EA $55.00] $ 7,700.00 $140.00] $ 19,600.00
39 128" Wide x 10’ High Sliding Gate 28 EA $4,300.00 $ 120,400.00 $2,500.00{ $ 70,000.00
40 128 Wide x 10' High Double Swing Gate 28 EA $2,200.00| $ 61,600.00 $2,900.00| $ 81,200.00
41 |4’ Wide x 10’ High Personnel Gate 28 EA $600.00] $ 16,800.00 $850.00| $ 23,800.00
42 |Single 10’ High Single Swing Gate {15’ to 20') 330 LF $74.00 $ 24,420.00 $150.00] $ 49,500.00
43 |10’ High K-Brace Gate (2’ to 32) 250 LF $110.00 27,500.00 $100.00 25,000.00
44 |Relocation of Existing 10' High Fence 2,300 LF $5.00 11,500.00 $23.00 52,900.00
45 110’ High Fencing Non-Paved Areas 8500 | LF $13.00] $ 110,500.00 $22.50]| $ 191,250.00

2117/2014
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Bid No. X1133902B1

FENCING - NEW, REPAIRS AND REPLACEMENT SERVICES
Agency: Port Everglades Department

Purchasing Agent: Jeannette Ferrell

APPROVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS MEETING HELD JANUARY 14, 2014 AGENDA ITEM NO. 32

Date Bid Posted: 11/4/2013

Date Bid Opened:
Bid Submittals:
Declinations: 0

2

11/20/2013

BRGVWVARD

Purchasing Division
wyow b1 oward.org’ irchasing

Bauer Construction Corporation Gomez and Son Fence
Tabulation of Bids 1812 NE 22 Terrace 2304 NW 30 Court #2304
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33305 Oakland Park, FL 33311
Item Commodity Code Qty | Unit | UnitPrice Total Price Unit Price Total Price
Description
46__|Vinyl Coating of Fence Fabric Black 60,000 SF $0.80| $ 48,000.00 $1.20| $ 72,000.00
10’ High Fencing, Color — Black, Ameristar “Impasse™" High
47 _|Security “Gauntlet” or Approved Equal 120 LF $ 17000 $ 20,400.00 $200.00{ $ 24 000.00
48 |4" Gate Post up to 10’ High Fence 20 EA $180.00| $ 3,600.00 $350.00{ $ 7,000.00
49 |6-5/8" Gate Post up to 10’ High Fence 20 EA $310.00| $ 6,200.00 $405.00( $ 8,100.00
50 16-5/8 " K Brace Gate Post up to 21’ High 20 EA $390.00| $ 7,800.00 $632.00[ $ 12,640.00
51 |8-5/8 " Gate Post up to 10’ High Fence 20 EA $475.00| $ 9,5600.00 $792.00{ $ 15,840.00
52 18-5/8 " K Brace Gate Post up to 21’ High 20 EA $625.00] $ 12,500.00 $1,202,00 $ 24,040.00
53 128’ Wide x 6’ High Cantilever Gate 32 EA $2,850.00| $ 91,200.00 $2,200.00[ $ 70,400.00
54 14’ Wide x 6’ High Gate 105 EA $415.00] $ 43,575.00 $190.00 $ 19,950.00
55 {28’ Wide x 6’ High Sliding Gate 35 EA $1,880.00| $ 65,800.00 $1,900.00{ $ 66,500.00
56 __|Liftmaster SL-585 1HP Slide Gate Operators or Approved Equal 5 EA $2,800.00| § 14,000.00 $2,500.00 $ 12,500.00
57 _ILiftmaster plug-in Loop Detectors or Approved Equal 5 EA $315.00| $ 1,575.00 $150.00] § 750.00
58 |Viking H-10 1HP Slide Gate Operators or Approved Equal 1 EA $3,000.00]| $ 3,000.00 $5,000.00] $ 5,000.00
59 IDitek DTK-120 Surge Protectors or Approved Equal 6 EA $90.00] $ 540.00 $250.00| $ 1,500.00
Saw cut Loop installations with 16ga XLPE crosslinked wire with
60 |Qseal sealant 6 EA $575.00| $ 3,450.00 $800.00! $ 4,800.00
61 |Operator Pads - Supply and Install 6 EA $500.00] $ 3,000.00 $1,300.00| § 7,800.00
62_ [Operator Pads - Removal of existing pads 6 EA $200.00| $ 1,200.00 $300.00; $ 1,800.00
63 |Centurion™ Aluminum 3 Rail or Approved Equal 5,000 LF $ 34001 § 170,000.00 $60.00] $ 300,000.00
63A [Centurion™ Steel Rail or Approved Equal 5,000 LF $ 4700 % 235,000.00 $0.00 No Bid (A)
Group 1 Subtotal $ 3,154,930.00 $ 3,282,710.00 (A)
Group 2 (ltems 64 through 71)
Permit Allowance for Agencies other than Broward County Board of
64 [County Commissioners - Port Everglades Use Only ALLOWANCE $ 1,000.00 $ 1,000.00
Permit Allowance for Agencies other than Broward County Board of | ALLOWANCE $ 1,000.00 $ 1,000.00
65 |County Commissioners - Parks and Recreation Use Only
Permit Allowance for Agencies other than Broward County Board of | ALLOWANCE $ 500.00 $ 500.00
66 _|County Commissioners - Facilities Maintenance Use Only
Permit Allowance for Agencies other than Broward County Board of
67 _|County Commissioners - Streets and Highways Use Only ALLOWANCE $ 500.00 $ 500.00
Permit Allowance for Agencies other than Broward County Board of
68 [County Commissioners - Water and Wastewater Use Only ALLOWANCE $ 500.00 $ 500.00
Permit Afowance for Agencies other than Broward County Board of
County Commissioners - Solid Waste and Recycling Services Use | ALLOWANCE 3 1,000.00 $ 1,000.00
69_[Only
Permit Allowance for Agencies other than Broward County Board of
70 |County Commissioners - Construction Management Use Only ALLOWANCE $ 500.00 § 500.00
Permit Allowance for Agencies other than Broward County Board of
County Commissioners - Highway Construction & Engineering Use | ALLOWANCE $ 500,00 $ 500.00
71 _|Only
Group 2 Subtotal $ 5,500.00 $ 5,500.00
Group 3 {Items 72 through 79) | I
2117/2014
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Bid No. X113390281

FENCING - NEW, REPAIRS AND REPLACEMENT SERVICES
Agency: Port Everglades Department

Purchasing Agent: Jeannette Ferrell

APPROVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS MEETING HELD JANUARY 14, 2014 AGENDA ITEM NO. 32

Date Bid Posted: 11/4/2013

Date Bid Opened:
Bid Submittals:
Declinations: 0

11/20/2013

BRIGVVAR|
. COUNTY

Purchasing Division
WA HE oy o ol gfparchasing

(A) Bidder did not bid item,

AWD:

Recommendation for Award

Prepared By: Jeannelte Ferrell

2/1712014
Bid Tabulation (09/12/2011)

Page 3 of 3

Bauer Construction Corporation Gomez and Son Fence
Tabulation of Bids 1812 NE 22 Terrace 2304 NW 30 Court #2304
Fort Lauderdale, FLL 33305 Oakland Park, FL 33311
Jtem Commodity Code Qty ‘ Unit |  Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
Description
72 |Parts Pass-thru Allowance for Port Everglades Use Only ALLOWANCE $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00
73 _|Parts Pass-thru Allowance for Park and Recreation Use Only ALLOWANCE $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00
74 _|Parts Pass-thru Allowance for Facilities Maintenance Use Only ALLOWANCE $ 1,000,00 $ 1,000.00
75 |Parts Pass-thru Allowance for Streets and Highways Use Only ALLOWANCE $ 1,000.00 $ 1,000.00
76__[Parts Pass-thru Allowance for Water and Wastewater Use Only ALLOWANCE $ 1,000.00 $ 1,000.00
Parts Pass-thru Allowance for Solid Waste and Recycling Services ALLOWANCE $ 1,000.00 $ 1,000,00
77_{Use Only
78 Parts Pass-thru Allowance for Construction Management Use Only | ALLOWANCE $ 1,000.00 $ 1,000.00
Parts Pass-thru Allowance for Highway Construction & Engineering ALLOWANCE $ 1,000.00 $ 1,000.00
79 |Use Only
Group 3 Subtotal $ 10,000.00 $ 10,000.00
Total Bid: | $3,170,430.00 $3,298,210.00 (A)
AWD




SUBMIT BID TO:

BRIGVVARD
= COUNTY

Broward County Purchasing Division
115 S. Andrews Avenue, Room 212
Fort Lauderdale, Florida 33301-1801
954-357-6066

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA

INVITATION FOR BID

Bidder Acknowledgment

— GENERAL CONDITIONS —

THESE INSTRUCTIONS ARE STANDARD FOR ALL CONTRACTS FOR COMMODITIES/SERVICES ISSUED BY THE
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS. THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS MAY DELETE, SUPERSEDE
OR MODIFY ANY OF THESE STANDARD INSTRUCTIONS FOR A PARTICULAR CONTRACT BY INDICATING SUCH
CHANGE IN THE SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS OR IN THE BID SHEETS. BY ACCEPTANCE OF A
PURCHASE ORDER ISSUED BY THE COUNTY, BIDDER AGREES THAT THE PROVISIONS INCLUDED WITHIN THIS
INVITATION FOR BID SHALL PREVAIL OVER ANY CONFLICTING PROVISION WITHIN ANY STANDARD FORM
CONTRACT OF THE BIDDER REGARDLESS OF ANY LANGUAGE IN BIDDER'S CONTRACT TO THE CONTRARY.

BIDDER ACKNOWLEDGEMENT MUST BE SIGNED AND RETURNED WITH YOUR BID

SEALED BIDS: This form must be executed and submitted
with all bid sheets and should be in a sealed envelope.
(PLEASE INCLUDE ONE ORIGINAL SIGNED BID DOCUMENT
IN BLUE INK AND ONE PHOTOCOPY OF SIGNED BID
DOCUMENT PER ENVELOPE). The face of the envelope should
contain the above address, the date and the time of bid opening,
and bid number. Bids not submitted on attached bid may be
rejected. All bids are subject to the conditions specified herein.
Those which do not comply with these conditions are subject to
rejection.

1. EXECUTION OF BID: A. Bid must contain an original
signature of an individual authorized to bind the bidder. Bid
must be typed or printed in ink. The ink should be blue ink. All
corrections made by bidder to their bid must also be initialed.
The bidder's name should also appear on each page of the
bid sheet if required. B. No award will be made to a bidder
who is delinquent in payment of any taxes, fees, fines,
contractual debts, judgments, or any other debts due and
owed to the County, or is in default on any contractual or
regulatory obligation to the County. By signing and submitting
this bid, bidder attests that it is not delinquent in payment of
any taxes, fees, fines, contractual debts, judgments or any
other debts due and owed to the County, nor is it in default on
any contractual or reguiatory obligation to the County. In the
event the bidder's statement is discovered to be false, bidder
will be subject to debarment and the County may terminate
any contract it has with bidder. C. Bidder certifies by signing
the bid that no principals or corporate officers of the firm were
principais or corporate officers in any other firm which may
have been suspended or debarred from doing business with
Broward County within the last three years, unless so noted in
the bid documents. D. By signing this bid, bidder attests that
any and all statements, oral, written or otherwise, made in
support of this bid, are accurate, true and correct. Bidder
acknowledges that inaccurate, untruthful, or incorrect
statements made in support of this bid may be used by the
County as a basis for rejection of this bid, rescission of the
award, or termination of the contract. Bidder acknowledges
that the termination of the contract because of a determination
of an inaccurate, untruthful, or incorrect statement made in
support of this bid may also serve as the basis for debarment
of bidder pursuant to Section 21-119 of the Broward County
Administrative Code.

2. BID WITHDRAWAL: No Vendor may withdraw their bid
before the expiration of one hundred and twenty (120) days
from the date of the bid opening. Any bid submitted which
alters the one hundred and twenty (120) day requirement
shall be deemed non-responsive.

(Continued on Page 2)

BIDS WILL BE OPENED 2:00 p.m.November 20, 2013
and may not be withdrawn within 120 calendar days after such date and time.

BID TITLE
Fencing ~ New, Repairs and Replacement Services

BIiD NO.X1133902B1

PURCHASING AGENT NAME & TELEPHONE NUMBER
Jeannette Ferrell, 954-468-3517

DELIVERY DATE

SEE SPECIAL INSTRUCTION

CASH DISCOUNT TERMS

BID GUARANTY IS ATTACHED, WHEN REQUIRED, IN
THE AMOUNT OF $

REASON FOR NO BID

DUN & BRADSTREET NUMBER

BIDDER NAME

BIDDER MAILING ADDRESS/CITY/STATE/ZIP

AREA CODE TELEPHONE NO. CONTACT PERSON

FAXNO. BIDDERS E-MAIL ADDRESS

[
*AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE DATE
(submit original in biue ink)
PRINT NAME TITLE

*| certify that this bid is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm or person submitting a bid for the same items/services, and is in all respects fair and
without collusion or fraud. | agree to abide by all conditions of this bid and certify that | am authorized to sign this bid for the bidder. Further by signature of this form, pages 1 through 6 are acknowledged

and accepted as well as any special instruction sheet(s) if applicable.




Jeffrey English

From: Ferrell, Jeannette <JFERRELL@broward.org>

Sent: Wednesday, May 18, 2016 9:30 AM

To: Jeffrey English

Cc: Nicole Louramore

Subject: RE: Authorization to piggyback X1133902B1 Fencing-New, Repairs and Replacement
Services

You are welcome to piggyback this contract.

Respectfully,

O%amelz‘a csrerrell

it COUNTY

L O & D A
Jeannette Ferrell, MBA, CPPB
Purchasing Agent
Purchasing Division: Port Everglades
1850 Eller Drive, 6™ Floor; Ft. Lauderdale, FL 33316
Office: (954) 468-3517 Fax: (954) 357-8549
jferrell@broward.org
www.broward.org/purchasing
www.broward.org/port

Customer Care is my priority. How am | doing? Please contact my Purchasing Manager, Carla Byrd, at
cbyrd@broward.org with feedback.

OL{F &e.S't e Keep it Grean
Nothing Less.

Please cmn:lder the emvironment before you print this e-mail.

From: Jeffrey English [mailto:Jeffrey.English@copbfl.com]

Sent: Wednesday, May 18, 2016 9:25 AM

To: Ferrell, Jeannette <JFERRELL@broward.org>

Cc: Nicole Louramore <Nicole.Louramore@copbfl.com>

Subject: Authorization to piggyback X1133902B1 Fencing-New, Repairs and Replacement Services

Hi Jeanette,

Per our conversation, the City of Pompano Beach needs to piggyback contract #X1133902B1 Fencing-New, Repairs and
Replacement Services. Your reply will suffice as written authorization for my file,

Thanks,

Jeff English
City of Pompano Beach
Purchasing Department



954-786-4098 — Office
954-786-4168 - Fax,

)beach.

Fiorida's Warmest Welcome

www.pompanobeachflgov

Under Florida law, most e-mail messages to or from Broward County employees or officials are public
records, available to any person upon request, absent an exemption. Therefore, any e-mail message
to or from the County, inclusive of e-mail addresses contained therein, may be subject to public
disclosure.



