
CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
BID H-36-12

BID TITLE: TREES FOR BIKE PATH LANDSCAPING
DATE: 04/27/2012

Bidder:

Agriculture in Motion 
Inc, 1121 Hallamwood 
Court, Lakland, FL  
33813

Angel Landscaping 
& Maintenance, 
1401 Village Blvd 
#1322, West Palm 
Beach, FL  33409

Bannerman 
Landscaping Inc, 
6600 N.W. 27th 
Avenue, Miami, FL  
33147

Calusa Creek Tree 
Farm, 4505 s.w. 
Kanner Hwy, Stuart, 
FL  34990

Landscape Service 
Professionals, 6115 
N.W. 77th Way, 
Tamarac, FL  33321

1. Slash Pine (Pinus Elliottli), 14'‑16' 4" 
cal, container grown, Florida #1

$100.00 $169.99 $250.00 no bid $195.00
total for 34 each $3,400.00 $5,779.66 $8,500.00  $6,630.00
Shipping charge for Slash Pine order $600.00 $499.00 $0.00 $1,825.00
TOTAL, SLASH PINE ORDER $4,000.00 $6,278.66 $8,500.00 $8,455.00

see Notes see Notes

2. Wild Tamarind (Lysiloma 
Latisiliquum), 14'‑16' oa, container 
grown, Florida #1 no bid $190.00 $250.00 no bid $150.00
total for 8 each  $1,520.00 $2,000.00  $1,200.00
Shipping charge for Wild Tamarind 
order $499.00 $0.00 $325.00
TOTAL, WILD TAMARIND 
ORDER $2,019.00 $2,000.00 $1,525.00

see Notes

3. Silver Buttonwood (Conocarpus 
Erectus Sericeus), 14'‑16', container 
grown, Florida #1 no bid $195.99 $250.00 no bid $200.00
total for 57 each  $11,171.43 $14,250.00  $11,400.00
Shipping charge for Silver Buttonwood 
order $499.00 $0.00 $700.00
TOTAL, SILVER BUTTONWOOD 
ORDER $11,670.43 $14,250.00 $12,100.00

see Notes see Notes
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
BID H-36-12

BID TITLE: TREES FOR BIKE PATH LANDSCAPING
DATE: 04/27/2012

Bidder:

Agriculture in Motion 
Inc, 1121 Hallamwood 
Court, Lakland, FL  
33813

Angel Landscaping 
& Maintenance, 
1401 Village Blvd 
#1322, West Palm 
Beach, FL  33409

Bannerman 
Landscaping Inc, 
6600 N.W. 27th 
Avenue, Miami, FL  
33147

Calusa Creek Tree 
Farm, 4505 s.w. 
Kanner Hwy, Stuart, 
FL  34990

Landscape Service 
Professionals, 6115 
N.W. 77th Way, 
Tamarac, FL  33321

4. Gumbo Limbo (Bursera Simaruba) 
14'‑16' oa, 65 gal., container grown, 
Florida #1 no bid $249.00 $250.00 no bid $265.00
total for 49 each  $12,201.00 $12,250.00  $12,985.00
Shipping charge for Gumbo Limbo 
order $499.00 $0.00 $800.00
TOTAL, GUMBO LIMBO ORDER $12,700.00 $12,250.00 $13,785.00

5. Live Oak (Quercus Virginiana) 22' 
6‑7" cal, container grown, Florida #1 $450.00 $699.00 $275.00 $325.00 $425.00
total for 47 each $21,150.00 $32,853.00 $12,925.00 $15,275.00 $19,975.00
Shipping charge for Live Oak order $0.00 $2,650.00 $0.00 $1,200.00 $1,800.00
TOTAL, LIVE OAK ORDER $21,150.00 $35,503.00 $12,925.00 $16,475.00 $21,775.00

see Notes see Notes see Notes

6. Dahoon Holly (Ilex Cassine) 14'‑16', 
container grown, Florida #1 no bid $174.99 $250.00 $125.00 $180.00
total for 47 each  $8,224.53 $11,750.00 $5,875.00 $8,460.00
Shipping charge for Dahoon Holly order

$499.00 $0.00 $400.00 $800.00
TOTAL, DAHOON HOLLY ORDER

$8,723.53 $11,750.00 $6,275.00 $9,260.00
see Notes
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
BID H-36-12

BID TITLE: TREES FOR BIKE PATH LANDSCAPING
DATE: 04/27/2012

Bidder:

Agriculture in Motion 
Inc, 1121 Hallamwood 
Court, Lakland, FL  
33813

Angel Landscaping 
& Maintenance, 
1401 Village Blvd 
#1322, West Palm 
Beach, FL  33409

Bannerman 
Landscaping Inc, 
6600 N.W. 27th 
Avenue, Miami, FL  
33147

Calusa Creek Tree 
Farm, 4505 s.w. 
Kanner Hwy, Stuart, 
FL  34990

Landscape Service 
Professionals, 6115 
N.W. 77th Way, 
Tamarac, FL  33321

7. Yellow Poinciana (Delonix 
Regia/Yellow Bloom) 14'‑16', container 
grown, Florida #1 no bid $185.00 $260.00 $110.00 $310.00
total for 47 each $8,695.00 $12,220.00 $5,170.00 $14,570.00
Shipping charge for Yellow Poinciana 
order $998.00 $0.00 $400.00 $800.00
TOTAL, YELLOW POINCIANA 
ORDER $9,693.00 $12,220.00 $5,570.00 $15,370.00

see Notes

8. Crape Myrtle (Lagerstroemia Indica) 
14'‑16' 3" cal, container or field grown, 
Florida #1 no bid $275.00 $250.00 $125.00 $225.00
total for 50 each  $13,750.00 $12,500.00 $6,250.00 $11,250.00
Shipping charge for Crape Myrtle order

$499.00 $0.00 $400.00 $800.00
TOTAL, CRAPE MYRTLE ORDER

$14,249.00 $12,500.00 $6,650.00 $12,050.00
see Notes see Notes

9. Cassia Surenttensis (Senna 
Surattensis) 14'‑16' 3" cal, container 
grown, Florida #1 no bid $205.00 $225.00 no bid $200.00
total for 55 each  $11,275.00 $12,375.00  $11,000.00
Shipping charge for Cassia Surenttensis 
order $505.00 $0.00 $800.00
TOTAL, CASSIA SURENTTENSIS 
ORDER $11,780.00 $12,375.00 $11,800.00

see Notes
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
BID H-36-12

BID TITLE: TREES FOR BIKE PATH LANDSCAPING
DATE: 04/27/2012

Bidder:

Agriculture in Motion 
Inc, 1121 Hallamwood 
Court, Lakland, FL  
33813

Angel Landscaping 
& Maintenance, 
1401 Village Blvd 
#1322, West Palm 
Beach, FL  33409

Bannerman 
Landscaping Inc, 
6600 N.W. 27th 
Avenue, Miami, FL  
33147

Calusa Creek Tree 
Farm, 4505 s.w. 
Kanner Hwy, Stuart, 
FL  34990

Landscape Service 
Professionals, 6115 
N.W. 77th Way, 
Tamarac, FL  33321

10. Purple Trumpet Tabebuia (Tabebuia 
Impetiginosa) 14'‑16', container grown, 
Florida #1 no bid $189.00 $265.00 $110.00 $320.00
total for 43 each  $8,127.00 $11,395.00 $4,730.00 $13,760.00
Shipping charge for Purple Trumpet 
Tabebuia $505.00 $0.00 $400.00 $800.00
TOTAL, PURPLE TRUMPET 
TABEBUIA $8,632.00 $11,395.00 $5,130.00 $14,560.00

see Notes

Deliver/Completion  a.r.o. 7 calendar days 3 calendar days 3 calendar days 2-3 calendar days 2-10 calendar days

Notes:

Item 1., Bidder states 
"pre-dug FG"; Item 5., 
"200 g. cont.", and 
"NC" for shipping

Item 3., extensions 
corrected for 
tabulation

Item 5., Bidder 
states "200 g. 6" cal 
20' oa; "3 semi 
loads @ $400"; Item 
6., "45 g. 12-14' oa", 
"1 semi load @ 
$400"; Item 7., 
"substitute option 
Golden Tabebuia 45 
g. 12' 
Chrystotrischa"; 
Item 8., "45 g. 10-
12' oa tuscorrora", 
"1 semi load"; Item 
10., "45 g. 12-14 
oa".

Item 1., Bidder 
states "alt. local field 
grown shipping 
$400 10-12' 
container $95"; Item 
2., "ht. not avail in 
container alt. 10-12' 
container $120"; 
Item 3., "alt. 10-12' 
$100"; Item 8., "alt. 
101-2' $125"; Items 
5. and 9., 
extensions 
corrected for 
tabulation.
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
BID H-36-12

BID TITLE: TREES FOR BIKE PATH LANDSCAPING
DATE: 04/27/2012

Bidder:

1. Slash Pine (Pinus Elliottli), 14'‑16' 4" 
cal, container grown, Florida #1

total for 34 each
Shipping charge for Slash Pine order
TOTAL, SLASH PINE ORDER

2. Wild Tamarind (Lysiloma 
Latisiliquum), 14'‑16' oa, container 
grown, Florida #1
total for 8 each
Shipping charge for Wild Tamarind 
order
TOTAL, WILD TAMARIND 
ORDER

3. Silver Buttonwood (Conocarpus 
Erectus Sericeus), 14'‑16', container 
grown, Florida #1
total for 57 each
Shipping charge for Silver Buttonwood 
order
TOTAL, SILVER BUTTONWOOD 
ORDER

MCT Service LLC, 
P.O. Box 163203, 
Miami, FL  33116

Mullings Engineering 
Services, - 
Landscaping Division, 
Inc, 6289 W Sunrise 
Blvd, #122, Sunrise, 
FL  33313

Pro Gardens Inc, 
15100 Persimmon 
Avenue, Delray Beach, 
FL  33446

Superior Landscaping 
& Lawn Services, Inc. 
6050 State Road 7, 
Coconut Creek, FL  
33073

$230.00 $210.00 no bid $192.00
$7,820.00 $7,140.00  $6,528.00

$200.00 $100.00 $720.00
$8,020.00 $7,240.00 $7,248.00

$300.00 $162.00 no bid $210.00
$2,400.00 $1,296.00  $1,680.00

$160.00 $100.00 $456.00

$2,560.00 $1,396.00 $2,136.00

$245.00 $210.00 no bid $240.00
$13,965.00 $11,970.00  $13,680.00

$200.00 $200.00 $720.00

$14,165.00 $12,170.00 $14,400.00
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
BID H-36-12

BID TITLE: TREES FOR BIKE PATH LANDSCAPING
DATE: 04/27/2012

Bidder:

4. Gumbo Limbo (Bursera Simaruba) 
14'‑16' oa, 65 gal., container grown, 
Florida #1
total for 49 each
Shipping charge for Gumbo Limbo 
order
TOTAL, GUMBO LIMBO ORDER

5. Live Oak (Quercus Virginiana) 22' 
6‑7" cal, container grown, Florida #1
total for 47 each
Shipping charge for Live Oak order
TOTAL, LIVE OAK ORDER

6. Dahoon Holly (Ilex Cassine) 14'‑16', 
container grown, Florida #1
total for 47 each
Shipping charge for Dahoon Holly order

TOTAL, DAHOON HOLLY ORDER

MCT Service LLC, 
P.O. Box 163203, 
Miami, FL  33116

Mullings Engineering 
Services, - 
Landscaping Division, 
Inc, 6289 W Sunrise 
Blvd, #122, Sunrise, 
FL  33313

Pro Gardens Inc, 
15100 Persimmon 
Avenue, Delray Beach, 
FL  33446

Superior Landscaping 
& Lawn Services, Inc. 
6050 State Road 7, 
Coconut Creek, FL  
33073

$230.00 $240.00 $150.00 $198.00
$11,270.00 $11,760.00 $7,350.00 $9,702.00

$200.00 $200.00 $2,450.00 $720.00
$11,470.00 $11,960.00 $9,800.00 $10,422.00

$427.00 $600.00 no bid $480.00
$20,069.00 $28,200.00  $22,560.00

$500.00 $500.00 $4,680.00
$20,569.00 $28,700.00 $27,240.00

$190.00 $200.00 no bid $240.00
$8,930.00 $9,400.00  $11,280.00

$200.00 $200.00 $540.00

$9,130.00 $9,600.00 $11,820.00
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
BID H-36-12

BID TITLE: TREES FOR BIKE PATH LANDSCAPING
DATE: 04/27/2012

Bidder:

7. Yellow Poinciana (Delonix 
Regia/Yellow Bloom) 14'‑16', container 
grown, Florida #1
total for 47 each
Shipping charge for Yellow Poinciana 
order
TOTAL, YELLOW POINCIANA 
ORDER

8. Crape Myrtle (Lagerstroemia Indica) 
14'‑16' 3" cal, container or field grown, 
Florida #1
total for 50 each
Shipping charge for Crape Myrtle order

TOTAL, CRAPE MYRTLE ORDER

9. Cassia Surenttensis (Senna 
Surattensis) 14'‑16' 3" cal, container 
grown, Florida #1
total for 55 each
Shipping charge for Cassia Surenttensis 
order
TOTAL, CASSIA SURENTTENSIS 
ORDER

MCT Service LLC, 
P.O. Box 163203, 
Miami, FL  33116

Mullings Engineering 
Services, - 
Landscaping Division, 
Inc, 6289 W Sunrise 
Blvd, #122, Sunrise, 
FL  33313

Pro Gardens Inc, 
15100 Persimmon 
Avenue, Delray Beach, 
FL  33446

Superior Landscaping 
& Lawn Services, Inc. 
6050 State Road 7, 
Coconut Creek, FL  
33073

$200.00 $330.00 no bid $210.00
$9,400.00 $15,510.00  $9,870.00

$800.00 $200.00 $540.00

$10,200.00 $15,710.00 $10,410.00

$200.00 $240.00 no bid $540.00
$10,000.00 $12,000.00  $27,000.00

$250.00 $200.00 $2,400.00

$10,250.00 $12,200.00 $29,400.00

$195.00 $210.00 no bid $270.00
$10,725.00 $11,550.00  $14,850.00

$250.00 $200.00 $900.00

$10,975.00 $11,750.00 $15,750.00
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
BID H-36-12

BID TITLE: TREES FOR BIKE PATH LANDSCAPING
DATE: 04/27/2012

Bidder:

10. Purple Trumpet Tabebuia (Tabebuia 
Impetiginosa) 14'‑16', container grown, 
Florida #1
total for 43 each
Shipping charge for Purple Trumpet 
Tabebuia
TOTAL, PURPLE TRUMPET 
TABEBUIA

Deliver/Completion  a.r.o.

Notes:

MCT Service LLC, 
P.O. Box 163203, 
Miami, FL  33116

Mullings Engineering 
Services, - 
Landscaping Division, 
Inc, 6289 W Sunrise 
Blvd, #122, Sunrise, 
FL  33313

Pro Gardens Inc, 
15100 Persimmon 
Avenue, Delray Beach, 
FL  33446

Superior Landscaping 
& Lawn Services, Inc. 
6050 State Road 7, 
Coconut Creek, FL  
33073

$260.00 $180.00 no bid $270.00
$11,180.00 $7,740.00  $11,610.00

$300.00 $200.00 $840.00

$11,480.00 $7,940.00 $12,450.00

7 calendar days 7-15 calendar days 4 calendar days 10 calendar days
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