CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: T-25-12 Title: First Aid and Safety Equipment

Date 04/17/12

Southeastern Laerdal Medical Direct
QuadMed Inc, 11210, Bound Tree Medical, | Emergency Equipment,| Corporation, PO Box | Products/Solutions, 34-
Ever Ready First Aid, Moore Medical LLC, | Henry Schein Inc, PO | HILLUSA Corporation, [ A .M. F. A. K. Inc, 555| 1 Philips Industrial LLC, 5000 Tuttle PO Box 1097, 1840, 167 Myers 52 42nd St, Suite 4-A, | Elifeguard Inc, 265
101-01 Foster Ave, 1690 New Britain Ave, | Box 3227, Irmo, SC 7215 NW 46th St, NW 95th St, Miami, FL| Blvd, Jacksonville, | Crossing Blvd, Dublin, | Youngsville, NC 27596-|Corners Rd, Wappingers Long Island City, NY Barnes Blvd,

Bidder: Brooklyn, NY 11236 | Farmington, CT 06032 29063 Miami, FL 33166 33150 FL 32256 OH 43016 1097 Falls, NY 12590 11101 Rockledge, FL 32955
Group A Encore Disposable Emergency $72.00} $53.60| $51.37| No Bid| $85.50 $64.95| No Bid| No Bid| No Bid| $74.83| No Bid
Blankets, 24 Blankets per case (to be
ordered by the case).
total for 100 CASES $7,200.00| $5,360.00 $5,137.00) $0.00| $8,550.00 $6,495.00] $0.00| $0.00| $0.00| $7,483.00 $0.00|
Delivery time ARO (calendar days) 14] No Response| 2| N/A| 5to 10| 1to 2| N/A| N/A| N/A] 3 N/A|
Group B Ambu Perfit ACE Cervical $182.00 $156.30 $121.80| $343.52 $220.00 $178.50 $120.00| $135.60| No Bid| Non-Responsive 389.7
Extrication Collar, 30 collars per case (to be
ordered by hthe case).
total for 35 CASES $6,370.00| $5,470.50 $4,263.00) $12,023.20] $7,700.00 $6,247.50| $4,200.00] $4,746.00] $0.00| $0.00| $13,639.50]
Delivery time ARO (calendar days) 14] 1to 3| 2| 30| 5to 10| 1to 2| 2to 3| 2to 3| N/A] 3 14
Group C Laerdal Sta-Blok Head Immobilizer] $172.00| $115.50 $108.90| $164.12) $150.00 $152.40| $117.30 $113.40 No Bid| $194.50 No Bid|
30 immobilizers per case (to be ordered by
the case).
total for 30 CASES $5,160.00| $3,465.00 $3,267.00) $4,923.60 $4,500.00 $4,572.00] $3,519.00 $3,402.00 $0.00| $5,835.00 $0.00|
Delivery time ARO (calendar days) 14] 1to 3| 2| 30| 5to 10| 1to 2| 2to 3| 2to 3| N/A] 3 N/A
Addendum Acknowledgec N/A] N/A| N/A] N/A| N/A| N/A] N/A| N/A| N/A] N/A| N/A|

Notes:

Bid is non-responsive.
Vendor bidded $12.29
per case for group B

item. No total provided

for item.
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