
CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION

Bid #: T-33-12 Title: Janitorial Services

Date 05/30/12

 

Bidder:

Image Janitorial 
Services, Inc, 814 
14th Street, Lake 
Park, FL 33403

MCJ and Professional 
Services, 161 NE 2nd 
Ave., Deerfield Beach, 

FL 33441

Ajax Consolidated 
Service Corp, 442 SW 

12th Ave, Deerfield 
Beach, FL 33442

New Experience 
Cleaning Services, Inc, 
50 NE 1st St, Pompano 

Beach, FL 33060

1 Total Monthly Amount for Lot I $5,161.00 $3,367.19 $3,752.20 $5,180.33

Total Amount for Exterior Window 
Cleaning for City Hall and Commission 
Chambers per visit

$1,950.00 $6,400.00 $1,590.00 $1,500.00

2 Total Monthly Amount for Lot II $3,484.00 $7,829.16 $3,152.50 $1,963.60

3 Total Monthly Amount for Lot III $6,450.00 $3,741.24 No-Bid No-Bid

Total Amount for Additional Cleaning 
Services / Special Events for Lot III per 
visit

$1,950.00 $23,698.50 No-Bid No-Bid

Addendum Acknowledged Yes Yes Yes No

Notes
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION

Bid #: T-33-12 Title: Janitorial Services

Date 05/30/12

Styles Janitorial Inc, 
20241 NW 27th Court, 

Miami Gardens, FL 33056

Admire Cleaning 
Service, 7000 SW 
16th St, Pompano 
Beach, FL 33023

Distinction 
Services, LLC, 625 

NE 11th Ave, 
Pompano Beach, 

FL 33060

Imperial Cleaning Corp 
dba Global Services, 

15476 NW 77th Court, 
#336, Miami Lakes, FL 

33016

Gilmore Janitorial 
Services, Inc, 4157 

Eastridge Circle, 
Pompano Beach, 

FL 33064

Digos Enterprises, 2010 
NW 1st Terrace, 

Pompano Beach, FL 
33060

No-bid $3,350.00 $3,202.00 $11,072.00 $3,121.00 $4,024.10

No-bid $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $500.00 $2,750.00 No-bid

No-bid $3,550.00 $3,292.00 $12,908.00 $3,585.00 $3,404.38

$4,950.00 $8,350.00 $6,843.75 $9,795.00 $3,825.00 $4,864.55

$100.00 $20.00 $225.00 $25/hr $100.00 $14.75

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION

Bid #: T-33-12 Title: Janitorial Services

Date 05/30/12

Cleaning Resources, 
Corp (CRC), 241 NW 

41st, Pompano 
Beach, FL 33064

Cleaning Systems 
Inc, 4620 N Hiatus 
Road, Sunrise, FL 

33351

United Services Inc, 
462 Forest St, 

Kearny, NJ 07032

T N M Services Inc, 31 
NE 1st Street, Pompano, 

FL 33060

Premiere Building 
Services, 1945 NE 

207th St, North Miami 
Beach, FL 33179

Coastal Building 
Maintenance, 15405 
NW 7th Ave, Miami, 

FL 33169

$3,890.00 $3,750.00 $40,541.96 $12,665.22 $2,833.20 $5,195.00

$620.00 $2,200.00 $2,550.00 $4,500.00 $1,250.00 No-bid

$3,320.00 $2,480.00 $46,667.73 $13,995.02 $2,534.86 $6,100.00

$4,880.00 $3,970.00 $83,974.01 $7,326.18 $7,343.93 $7,600.00

$210.00 $30.00 No-bid $1,831.54 $17/hr/per person $250.00

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
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