CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: H-26-13 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/01/13

ASA Football, 3064 Point
Township Dr.,

BSN Sports, P.O. Box 49,

Matty's Sports, Inc., 7911
N.W. 72 Avenue, Suite 106,

OLC Solutions, 4

717 N.E.

12 Avenue, Oakland Park,

Paradise Sunshine Sports,
2210 N.W. 3rd Avenue, Unit
5B, Pompano Beach, FL

PrimeTime Apparel, 10401
Broward Blvd., Ste. 209,

Bidder: Northumberland, PA 17857 |Jenkintown, PA 19046 Miami, FL 33166 FL 33334 33060 Plantation, FL 33324
GROUP 1 - GAME UNIFORMS no bid no bid
Game jersey, Game On Falcons

Game Jersey, or equal no bid

Size Youth X-Small, each: $62.00 $54.95 $52.50

total for 30: $1,860.00 $1,648.50 $1,575.00

Size Youth Small, each $62.00 $54.95 $52.50

total for 60: $3,720.00 $3,297.00 $3,150.00

Size Youth Medium, each: $62.00 $54.95 $52.50

total for 120: $7,440.00 $6,594.00 $6,300.00

Size Youth Large, each:A12 $62.00 $54.95 $52.50

total for 60: $3,720.00 $3,297.00 $3,150.00

Game jersey, Manufacturer/style Universal Athletic/Style

number bid: Bidder states "as spec'd" MATJAC - FALCON 2297

Game pant, Game On FPLSN Youth

Game Pants, or equal no bid

Size Youth X-Small, each: $22.00 $15.50 $19.95

Total for 30: $660.00 $465.00 $598.50

Size Youth Small, each: $22.00 $15.50 $19.95

Total for 60: $1,320.00 $930.00 $1,197.00

Size Youth Medium, each: $22.00 $15.50 $19.95

Total for 120: $2,640.00 $1,860.00 $2,394.00

Size Youth Large, each: $22.00 $15.50 $19.95

Total for 60: $1,320.00 $930.00 $1,197.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Bidder states "as spec'd" MARTIN #FDFPY Champro/ Style FPY9

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 1 no bid $22,680.00 $19,021.50 $19,561.50|no bid no bid

Group 1 delivery time a.r.o., no later
than 7-31-13:

30 calendar days

28 calendar days

60 calendar days
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: H-26-13 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/01/13

Bidder:

ASA Football, 3064 Point
Township Dr.,
Northumberland, PA 17857

BSN Sports, P.O. Box 49,
Jenkintown, PA 19046

Matty's Sports, Inc., 7911
N.W. 72 Avenue, Suite 106,
Miami, FL 33166

OLC Solutions, 4717 N.E.
12 Avenue, Oakland Park,
FL 33334

Paradise Sunshine Sports,
2210 N.W. 3rd Avenue, Unit
5B, Pompano Beach, FL
33060

PrimeTime Apparel, 10401
Broward Blvd., Ste. 209,
Plantation, FL 33324

GROUP 2 - PRACTICE PANTS, Game

On, or equal no bid no bid

Youth X-Small size, each: $10.90 $15.00 $16.20 $19.00
Total for 115: $1,253.50 $1,725.00 $1,863.00 $2,185.00
Youth Small size, each: $10.90 $15.00 $16.20 $19.00
Total for 165: $1,798.50 $2,475.00 $2,673.00 $3,135.00
Youth Medium size, each: $10.90 $15.00 $16.20 $19.00
Total for 295 : $3,215.50 $4,425.00 $4,779.00 $5,605.00
Youth Large size, each: $10.90 $15.00 $16.20 $19.00
Total for 115 : $1,253.50 $1,725.00 $1,863.00 $2,185.00
Youth X-Large size, each: $10.90 $15.00 $16.20 $19.00
Total for 34 : $370.60 $510.00 $550.80 $646.00
Youth XX-Large size, each: $10.90 $16.00 $16.20 $19.00
Total for 6 : $65.40 $96.00 $97.20 $114.00
Adult Small size, each: $12.60 $17.00 $16.20 $19.00
Total for 20 : $252.00 $340.00 $324.00 $380.00
Manufacturer/style number bid: ASA Football/ 50121 MARTIN #FPADY Champro/FPC Intimidator Champro Sports/FPC
GRAND TOTAL GROUP 2 $8,209.00|no bid $11,296.00 $12,150.00|no bid $14,250.00
Group 2 delivery time a.r.o., no later

than 6-18-13: 21 calendar days 14 calendar days 30 calendar days 30 calendar days

GROUP 3 - SHOULDER PADS no bid

X-Small, as per specifications, each: $23.65 $30.99 $24.25 $49.95 $105.00

Total for 42: $993.30 $1,301.58 $1,018.50 $2,097.90 $4,410.00

Small, as per specifications, each: $25.35 $32.99 $26.25 $49.95 $105.00

Total for 32: $811.20 $1,055.68 $840.00 $1,598.40 $3,360.00

Medium, as per specifications, each: $27.05 $36.99 $27.90 $49.95 $105.00
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: H-26-13 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/01/13

ASA Football, 3064 Point

Matty's Sports, Inc., 7911

OLC Solutions, 4717 N.E.

Paradise Sunshine Sports,
2210 N.W. 3rd Avenue, Unit

PrimeTime Apparel, 10401

Township Dr., BSN Sports, P.O. Box 49, |N.W. 72 Avenue, Suite 106, |12 Avenue, Oakland Park, |5B, Pompano Beach, FL Broward Blvd., Ste. 209,
Bidder: Northumberland, PA 17857 |Jenkintown, PA 19046 Miami, FL 33166 FL 33334 33060 Plantation, FL 33324
Total for 37: $1,000.85 $1,368.63 $1,032.30 $1,848.15 $3,885.00
Large, as per specifications, each: $27.90 $37.99 $30.50 $49.95 $105.00
Total for 30: $837.00 $1,139.70 $915.00 $1,498.50 $3,150.00
X-Large, as per specifications, each: $31.30 $38.99 $31.75 $49.95 $105.00
Total for 10: $313.00 $389.90 $317.50 $499.50 $1,050.00
Champro/ FSP 1060 Air Gear Pro-Tec/Athletic
Manufacturer/style number bid: Tech Gear Air Tech CHAMPRO AIR TECH Champro/FSPV Vertex Connection
GRAND TOTAL GROUP 3 $3,955.35 $5,255.49 $4,123.30 $7,542.45 $15,855.00|no bid

Group 3 delivery time a.r.o., no later
than 6-18-13:

21 calendar days

18 calendar days

21 calendar days

30 calendar days

7 calendar days

GROUP 4 - FOOTBALL EQUIPMENT

ITEM 1, HELMETS, Riddell
Revolution Attack Youth Helmet, or

equal no bid no bid
XX-Small, each: $65.21 $59.95 $58.99 $109.99
Total for 17: $1,108.57 $1,019.15 $1,002.83 $1,869.83
X-Small, each: $55.16 $59.95 $58.99 $109.99
total for 30: $1,654.80 $1,798.50 $1,769.70 $3,299.70
Small, each: $55.16 $59.95 $58.99 $109.99
total for 27: $1,489.32 $1,618.65 $1,592.73 $2,969.73
Medium, each: $55.16 $59.95 $58.99 $109.99
total for 32: $1,765.12 $1,918.40 $1,887.68 $3,519.68
Large, each: $55.16 $59.95 $58.99 $109.99
total for 28: $1,544.48 $1,678.60 $1,651.72 $3,079.72
X-Large, each: $55.16 $59.95 $58.99 $129.99
total for 14: $772.24 $839.30 $825.86 $1,819.86
XX-Large, each: $92.21 $125.00 $70.00 $129.99
total for 13: $1,198.73 $1,625.00 $910.00 $1,689.87
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: H-26-13 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/01/13

Bidder:

ASA Football, 3064 Point
Township Dr.,
Northumberland, PA 17857

BSN Sports, P.O. Box 49,
Jenkintown, PA 19046

Matty's Sports, Inc., 7911
N.W. 72 Avenue, Suite 106,
Miami, FL 33166

OLC Solutions, 4717 N.E.
12 Avenue, Oakland Park,
FL 33334

Paradise Sunshine Sports,
2210 N.W. 3rd Avenue, Unit
5B, Pompano Beach, FL
33060

PrimeTime Apparel, 10401
Broward Blvd., Ste. 209,
Plantation, FL 33324

Manufacturer/style number bid:

XXS Rawlings NRG Force,
XS-XL Schutt Air Standard
I1l, XXL Schutt XPOR
Recruit Hybrid +

Rawlings
Momentum/Impulse Force

Rawlings/NRG Momentum

Schutt "New
Design"/Athletic Connection
#1375452

TOTAL ITEM 1: $9,533.26|no bid $10,497.60 $9,640.52 $18,248.39|no bid
ITEM 2, FOOTBALLS no bid
K2, each: $30.60 $29.45 $29.50 $32.57 $21.99
total for 41.: $1,254.60 $1,207.45 $1,209.50 $1,335.37 $901.59
TDK, each: $30.60 $30.62 $30.99 $34.31 $21.99
total for 59: $1,805.40 $1,806.58 $1,828.41 $2,024.29 $1,297.41
TDY, each: $30.60 $34.18 $33.99 $35.71 $21.99
total for 24: $734.40 $820.32 $815.76 $857.04 $527.76

Athletic Connection Spiral -
Tech Nike Composite

Series #1273366,
1273359,1273342 &
Manufacturer/style number bid: Spalding Leather / 629258 |Wilson as spec'd Wilson #1382/1360/1300 Wilson 1273335
TOTAL ITEM 2: $3,794.40 $3,834.35 $3,853.67 $4,216.70 $2,726.76|no bid
ITEM 3, JAW PADS no bid no bid
X-Small, each: no bid $1.49 $3.10 $54.00
Total for 20: $29.80 $62.00 $1,080.00
Small, each: $2.55 $1.49 $3.10 $54.00
total for 60: $153.00 $89.40 $186.00 $3,240.00
Medium, each: $2.55 $1.49 $3.10 $54.00
total for 60: $153.00 $89.40 $186.00 $3,240.00
Large, each: no bid $1.49 $3.10 $54.00
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: H-26-13 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/01/13

ASA Football, 3064 Point
Township Dr.,

BSN Sports, P.O. Box 49,

Matty's Sports, Inc., 7911
N.W. 72 Avenue, Suite 106,

OLC Solutions, 4717 N.E.
12 Avenue, Oakland Park,

Paradise Sunshine Sports,
2210 N.W. 3rd Avenue, Unit
5B, Pompano Beach, FL

PrimeTime Apparel, 10401
Broward Blvd., Ste. 209,

Bidder: Northumberland, PA 17857 |Jenkintown, PA 19046 Miami, FL 33166 FL 33334 33060 Plantation, FL 33324
total for 200: $298.00 $620.00 $10,800.00
X-Large, each: no bid $1.49 $3.10 $54.00
total for 100: $149.00 $310.00 $5,400.00
XX-Large, each: $2.55 $1.49 $3.10 $54.00
total for 30: $76.50 $44.70 $93.00 $1,620.00

Athletic Specialties/JPM

Athletic Connection

Manufacturer/style number bid: Universal Athletic Specialties #JPM Athletic Specialties / JIPM #FBUJPDZ
TOTAL ITEM 3: Incomplete bid no bid $700.30 $1,457.00 $25,380.00|no bid
ITEM 4, CHIN STRAPS no bid no bid
Youth, high hook up, each: $3.68 $4.49 $5.80 $3.50
Total for 420: $1,545.60 $1,885.80 $2,436.00 $1,470.00
Youth, low hook up, each: $3.40 $3.79 $4.35 $3.50
Total for 20: $510.00 $568.50 $652.50 $525.00
Adult, low hook up, each: $4.18 $3.79 $4.35 $3.50
Total for 20: $125.40 $113.70 $130.50 $105.00
Athletic Specialties/High
RCA49A, Low 54A, Low Athletic Specialties Athletic Connection/Adams
Manufacturer/style number bid: RC54 #RCS9/YCSZ/RCSB Athletic Specialties/YCS #1405465 & #1420340
TOTAL ITEM 4: $2,181.00|no bid $2,568.00 $3,219.00 $2,100.00|no bid
ITEM 5, KEYWAY HOOKS no bid
1", each: $0.20 $0.18 $0.30 $0.26 $24.99
Total for 50: $10.00 $9.00 $15.00 $13.00 $1,249.50
1-1/2", each: $0.23 $0.21 $0.39 $0.33 $29.99
Total for 50: $11.50 $10.50 $19.50 $16.50 $1,499.50
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: H-26-13 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/01/13

Bidder:

ASA Football, 3064 Point
Township Dr.,
Northumberland, PA 17857

BSN Sports, P.O. Box 49,
Jenkintown, PA 19046

Matty's Sports, Inc., 7911
N.W. 72 Avenue, Suite 106,
Miami, FL 33166

OLC Solutions, 4717 N.E.
12 Avenue, Oakland Park,
FL 33334

Paradise Sunshine Sports,
2210 N.W. 3rd Avenue, Unit
5B, Pompano Beach, FL
33060

PrimeTime Apparel, 10401
Broward Blvd., Ste. 209,
Plantation, FL 33324

Athletic Specialties/ KS1 &

BSN FBKWM100PK-

Athletic Specialties

Athletic Specialties

Manufacturer/style number bid: KS2 FBKWM105PK, pg 129 #KS1/KS2 #KS1/KS2 Athletic Connection

TOTAL ITEM 5: $21.50 $19.50 $34.50 $29.50 $2,749.00|no bid

ITEM 6, "T" HOOKS no bid

1", each: $0.57 $0.25 $0.39 $0.36 $20.24

Total for 350: $199.50 $87.50 $136.50 $126.00 $7,084.00

1-1/2", each: $0.49 $0.28 $0.44 $0.33 $29.99

Total for 350: $171.50 $98.00 $154.00 $115.50 $10,496.50
Athletic Connection
#FBTH150XPK,
#FBKWM100PK,

Athletic Specialties/ SPH-1- |[BSN FBTH100XPK- Athletic Specialties Athletic Specialties FBKWM150PK,

Manufacturer/style number bid: 55 & SPH-2-55 FBTH150XPK, pg 129 #THL/TH2 #TH1/TH2 FBTH100PK

TOTAL ITEM 6: $371.00 $185.50 $290.50 $241.50 $17,580.50|no bid

ITEM 7, TRAINER TAPE no bid no bid

1", Black, per case: $63.25 $59.00 $44.00 $75.00

Total for 3: $189.75 $177.00 $132.00 $225.00

1-1/2", White, per case: $41.65 $59.00 $48.00 $75.00

Total for 2: $83.30 $118.00 $96.00 $150.00

Cramer/ 280100 & Athletic

Manufacturer/style number bid: Specialties/ ATAPE Mueller M Tape Athletic Specialties not identified

TOTAL ITEM 7: $273.05|no bid $295.00 $228.00 $375.00|no bid

ITEM 8, ELASTIC STRAP no bid no bid
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: H-26-13 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/01/13

ASA Football, 3064 Point

Matty's Sports, Inc., 7911

OLC Solutions, 4717 N.E.

Paradise Sunshine Sports,
2210 N.W. 3rd Avenue, Unit

PrimeTime Apparel, 10401

Township Dr., BSN Sports, P.O. Box 49, |N.W. 72 Avenue, Suite 106, |12 Avenue, Oakland Park, |5B, Pompano Beach, FL Broward Blvd., Ste. 209,
Bidder: Northumberland, PA 17857 |Jenkintown, PA 19046 Miami, FL 33166 FL 33334 33060 Plantation, FL 33324
1", Black, per roll: $16.15 $18.34 $26.25 $30.00
Total for 5: $80.75 $91.70 $131.25 $150.00
1-1/2", White, per roll: $28.05 $26.27 $32.25 $30.00
Total for 2: $56.10 $52.54 $64.50 $60.00

Athletic Specialties/ 1"

BSN FBRE100B-

Athletic Specialties

Manufacturer/style number bid: NPEB & 1 1/2 WPEB FBRE150B, pg 129 #NPEB/WPEB Athletic Specialties #NPEB

TOTAL ITEM 8: $136.85 $144.24 $195.75 $210.00|no bid no bid

ITEM 9, MISCELLANEOUS

a. Belts, black, each: $17.00 $0.62 $0.99 $1.05 $2.69|no bid

Total for 120 $2,040.00 $74.40 $118.80 $126.00 $322.80
Athletic Connection

Manufacturer/style number bid: Athletic Specialties/ PWB  |BSN FBBLT1, PG 138 Martin #FFB Champro/FWB #FBBLT1

b. Mouth Pieces, each: $0.33 $0.29 $0.39 $0.55 $13.99|no bid

Total for 1000: $331.50 $290.00 $390.00 $550.00 $13,990.00
Athletic Connection

Manufacturer/style number bid: Wilson/WTFMG1050 BSN MSMOUT, PG 138 Safety Guard #MG Adams USA #1179613 & #MS MOUT

c. Whistles, each: $0.51 $0.24 $0.59 $0.50 $9.99|no bid

Total for 140: $71.40 $33.60 $82.60 $70.00 $1,398.60
Athletic Connection

Manufacturer/style number bid: Champro/ A323 BSN 3059XXXXDZ, pg 284 |Athletic Specialties #WSB |Champro/A325 #3059xxxxDZ

d. Lanyards, each: $6.80 $0.24 $0.60 $0.48 $9.99 |no bid

Total for 140: $952.00 $33.60 $84.00 $67.20 $1,398.60
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: H-26-13 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/01/13

ASA Football, 3064 Point
Township Dr.,

BSN Sports, P.O. Box 49,

Matty's Sports, Inc., 7911
N.W. 72 Avenue, Suite 106,

OLC Solutions, 4717 N.E.
12 Avenue, Oakland Park,

Paradise Sunshine Sports,
2210 N.W. 3rd Avenue, Unit
5B, Pompano Beach, FL

PrimeTime Apparel, 10401
Broward Blvd., Ste. 209,

Bidder: Northumberland, PA 17857 |Jenkintown, PA 19046 Miami, FL 33166 FL 33334 33060 Plantation, FL 33324
Athletic Connection
Manufacturer/style number bid: Champro/A324 BSN MSLNYD, pg 284 Athletic Specialties #LAN Champro/324-B #MSLNYD
e. Shoulder Pad Laces, each: $23.80 $0.16 $0.20 $0.17 $23.00|no bid
Total for 200: $4,760.00 $32.00 $40.00 $34.00 $4,600.00
Manufacturer/style number bid: Adams SPL Black BSN BSN FBSPL36B, pg 12|Athletic Specialties #SYL Athletic Specialties/SPL
f. Pylon Markers, each: $22.95 $4.94 $26.75 $10.80 $30.00/|no bid
Total for 12: $275.40 $59.28 $321.00 $129.60 $360.00
Athletic Connection
Manufacturer/style number bid: Athle/SFW BSN MSWPYLON, pg 118 |Martin #EZP4 Athletic Specialties/SFW #MSWPYLON
g.Yard Markers, per set: $73.95 $184.43 $125.00 $108.00 $139.99|no bid
Total for 2: $147.90 $368.86 $250.00 $216.00 $279.98
Athletic Connection
Manufacturer/style number bid: Athletic Specialties/ SYM-O |BSN 1245134, pg 118 Martin #SLM11 Athletic Specialties/SYM #1249354
h. Down Markers, per set: $86.70 $162.57 $175.00 $185.00 $130.99 no bid
Total for 1: $86.70 $162.57 $175.00 $185.00 $130.99
Athletic Connection
Manufacturer/style number bid: Athletic Specialties/DB03 BSN FBVD1CSX Athletic Specialties #LSI Athletic Specialties #LSI #1196160
TOTAL ITEM 9 (a-h): $8,664.90 $1,054.31 $1,461.40 $1,377.80 $22,480.97 |no bid
Incomplete bid for Group, |Incomplete bid for Group,
cannot be considered per |cannot be considered per
Section | - Section | -
Specifications/Special Specifications/Special
GRAND TOTAL GROUP 4 (ITEMS 1- |Conditions, C. Bid Conditions, C. Bid
9) Iltems/Grouping Items/Grouping $19,896.72 $20,620.02 $91,640.62|no bid
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: H-26-13 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/01/13

Bidder:

ASA Football, 3064 Point
Township Dr.,
Northumberland, PA 17857

BSN Sports, P.O. Box 49,
Jenkintown, PA 19046

Matty's Sports, Inc., 7911
N.W. 72 Avenue, Suite 106,
Miami, FL 33166

OLC Solutions, 4717 N.E.
12 Avenue, Oakland Park,
FL 33334

Paradise Sunshine Sports,
2210 N.W. 3rd Avenue, Unit
5B, Pompano Beach, FL
33060

PrimeTime Apparel, 10401
Broward Blvd., Ste. 209,
Plantation, FL 33324

Group 4 delivery time a.r.o., no later
than 6-18-13:

30 calendar days

21 calendar days

14 calendar days

30 calendar days

30 calendar days

Acknowledged addenda?

yes, 1 &2

yes, 1 &2

yes, 1 &2

yes, 1 &2

yes, 1 &2

yes, 1 &2

Notes:

Group 4, Items 3, 4,5, 6, 7,
9a, 9d, 9f, extensions
corrected for tabulation

Group 4: Item 3 Bidder
states unit price $54/dzn,
Item 5 Bidder states unit
price $24.99 and $29.99 pk,
Item 6 Bidder states $20.24
and $29.99 pk, Item 9b
$13.99 pk 25, Item 9c $9.99
dzn, Item 9d $9.99 dzn,
Item 9e $23.00 per 144;
extensions corrected for
tabulation
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: H-26-13 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/01/13

Bidder:

Riddell/All American, 669
Sugar Lane, Elyria, OH
44035-6309

The Player's Connection of
Florida LLC, 12900 West
State Road 84, Davie, FL
33325

GROUP 1 - GAME UNIFORMS

Game jersey, Game On Falcons
Game Jersey, or equal

Size Youth X-Small, each: $51.62 $58.95
total for 30: $1,548.60 $1,768.50
Size Youth Small, each $51.62 $58.95
total for 60: $3,097.20 $3,537.00
Size Youth Medium, each: $51.62 $58.95
total for 120: $6,194.40 $7,074.00
Size Youth Large, each:A12 $51.62 $58.95
total for 60: $3,097.20 $3,537.00

Game jersey, Manufacturer/style
number bid:

Riddell FYJFR32

Game Gear Style 991

Game pant, Game On FPLSN Youth
Game Pants, or equal

Size Youth X-Small, each: $22.70 $20.95
Total for 30: $681.00 $628.50
Size Youth Small, each: $22.70 $20.95
Total for 60: $1,362.00 $1,257.00
Size Youth Medium, each: $22.70 $20.95
Total for 120: $2,724.00 $2,514.00
Size Youth Large, each: $22.70 $20.95
Total for 60: $1,362.00 $1,257.00

Manufacturer/style number bid:

Riddell YGPW

Wilson Style WTF5721

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 1

$20,066.40

$21,573.00

Group 1 delivery time a.r.o., no later
than 7-31-13:

45 calendar days

30 calendar days
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: H-26-13 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/01/13

Bidder:

Riddell/All American, 669
Sugar Lane, Elyria, OH
44035-6309

The Player's Connection of
Florida LLC, 12900 West
State Road 84, Davie, FL
33325

GROUP 2 - PRACTICE PANTS, Game
On, or equal

Youth X-Small size, each: $9.66 $18.25
Total for 115: $1,110.90 $2,098.75
Youth Small size, each: $9.66 $18.25
Total for 165: $1,593.90 $3,011.25
Youth Medium size, each: $9.66 $18.25
Total for 295 : $2,849.70 $5,383.75
Youth Large size, each: $9.66 $18.25
Total for 115 : $1,110.90 $2,098.75
Youth X-Large size, each: $9.66 $18.25
Total for 34 : $328.44 $620.50
Youth XX-Large size, each: $9.66 $18.25
Total for 6 : $57.96 $109.50
Adult Small size, each: $11.70 $18.25
Total for 20 : $234.00 $365.00

Manufacturer/style number bid:

Riddell YPPW/PPW

Wilson WTF572400 Yourth,
WTF5616 Adult

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 2

$7,285.80

$13,687.50

Group 2 delivery time a.r.o., no later
than 6-18-13:

30 calendar days

30 calendar days

GROUP 3 - SHOULDER PADS

X-Small, as per specifications, each: $19.20 $30.99
Total for 42: $806.40 $1,301.58
Small, as per specifications, each: $20.25 $31.99
Total for 32: $648.00 $1,023.68
Medium, as per specifications, each: $22.60 $35.99
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: H-26-13 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/01/13

Riddell/All American, 669
Sugar Lane, Elyria, OH

The Player's Connection of
Florida LLC, 12900 West
State Road 84, Davie, FL

Bidder: 44035-6309 33325

Total for 37: $836.20 $1,331.63
Large, as per specifications, each: $23.30 $36.99
Total for 30: $699.00 $1,109.70
X-Large, as per specifications, each: $25.50 $38.99
Total for 10: $255.00 $389.90
Manufacturer/style number bid: Riddell #48280 Gear Air Tech

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 3 $3,244.60 $5,156.49
Group 3 delivery time a.r.o., no later

than 6-18-13: 30 calendar days 30 calendar days

GROUP 4 - FOOTBALL EQUIPMENT

ITEM 1, HELMETS, Riddell

Revolution Attack Youth Helmet, or

equal

XX-Small, each: $51.99 $48.99
Total for 17: $883.83 $832.83
X-Small, each: $51.99 $48.99
total for 30: $1,559.70 $1,469.70
Small, each: $51.99 $48.99
total for 27: $1,403.73 $1,322.73
Medium, each: $51.99 $48.99
total for 32: $1,663.68 $1,567.68
Large, each: $51.99 $48.99
total for 28: $1,455.72 $1,371.72
X-Large, each: $51.99 $48.99
total for 14: $727.86 $685.86
XX-Large, each: $69.99 $68.99
total for 13: $909.87 $896.87
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: H-26-13 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/01/13

Bidder:

Riddell/All American, 669
Sugar Lane, Elyria, OH
44035-6309

The Player's Connection of
Florida LLC, 12900 West
State Road 84, Davie, FL
33325

Manufacturer/style number bid: Riddell Attack/Edge (Adult) |Schutt Air Standard

TOTAL ITEM 1: $8,604.39 $8,147.39
ITEM 2, FOOTBALLS

K2, each: $24.00 $30.47
total for 41: $984.00 $1,249.27
TDK, each: $26.50 $31.87
total for 59: $1,563.50 $1,880.33
TDY, each: $26.50 $35.36
total for 24: $636.00 $848.64

Manufacturer/style number bid:

Riddell 42335, 42334 &
42333

Wilson, 1382B, 13608,
1300B

TOTAL ITEM 2: $3,183.50 $3,978.24
ITEM 3, JAW PADS

X-Small, each: $1.10|no bid

Total for 20: $22.00

Small, each: $1.10 $3.31
total for 60: $66.00 $198.60
Medium, each: $1.10 $5.10
total for 60: $66.00 $306.00
Large, each: $5.00 $3.31
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: H-26-13 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/01/13

Riddell/All American, 669
Sugar Lane, Elyria, OH

The Player's Connection of
Florida LLC, 12900 West
State Road 84, Davie, FL

Bidder: 44035-6309 33325

total for 200: $1,000.00 $662.00
X-Large, each: $5.00 $3.31
total for 100: $500.00 $331.00
XX-Large, each: $1.10 $3.57
total for 30: $33.00 $107.10

Manufacturer/style number bid:

Riddell 45727/45750

Schutt, Universal, DNA

TOTAL ITEM 3:

$1,687.00

Incomplete bid

ITEM 4, CHIN STRAPS

Youth, high hook up, each: $2.90 $5.23
Total for 420: $1,218.00 $2,196.60
Youth, low hook up, each: $2.90 $2.99
Total for 20: $435.00 $448.50
Adult, low hook up, each: $2.90 $4.14
Total for 20: $87.00 $124.20
Manufacturer/style number bid: Riddell 45767 & 45747 Adams, Schutt

TOTAL ITEM 4: $1,740.00 $2,769.30
ITEM 5, KEYWAY HOOKS

1", each: $0.30 $0.32
Total for 50: $15.00 $16.00
1-1/2", each: $0.30 $0.32
Total for 50: $15.00 $16.00
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: H-26-13 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/01/13

Riddell/All American, 669
Sugar Lane, Elyria, OH

The Player's Connection of
Florida LLC, 12900 West
State Road 84, Davie, FL

Bidder: 44035-6309 33325

Manufacturer/style number bid: Riddell 1204 & 1207 Adams

TOTAL ITEM 5: $30.00 $32.00
ITEM 6, "T" HOOKS

1", each: $0.30 $0.54
Total for 350: $105.00 $189.00
1-1/2", each: $0.30 $0.54
Total for 350: $105.00 $189.00

Manufacturer/style number bid:

Riddell 1208 & 1219

Adams SPH-1 and SPH-2

TOTAL ITEM 6: $210.00 $378.00
ITEM 7, TRAINER TAPE

1", Black, per case: $65.00 $57.85
Total for 3: $195.00 $173.55
1-1/2", White, per case: $48.00 $57.85
Total for 2: $96.00 $115.70
Manufacturer/style number bid: Riddell 60202 Mueller

TOTAL ITEM 7: $291.00 $289.25

ITEM 8, ELASTIC STRAP
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: H-26-13 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/01/13

Riddell/All American, 669
Sugar Lane, Elyria, OH

The Player's Connection of
Florida LLC, 12900 West
State Road 84, Davie, FL

Bidder: 44035-6309 33325

1", Black, per roll: $22.00 $18.00

Total for 5: $110.00 $90.00

1-1/2", White, per roll: $25.00 $22.20

Total for 2: $50.00 $44.40
Adams SPE-1 BK and SPE-

Manufacturer/style number bid: Riddell 2 BK

TOTAL ITEM 8: $160.00 $134.40

ITEM 9, MISCELLANEOUS

a. Belts, black, each: $0.73 $0.90

Total for 120 $87.60 $108.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Riddell WB52 Adams

b. Mouth Pieces, each: $0.36 $0.28

Total for 1000: $360.00 $280.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Riddell 45791 MG302-Bulk

c. Whistles, each: $1.25 $0.45

Total for 140: $175.00 $63.00

Manufacturer/style number bid:

Ath. Specialties PLC

BP-1 in Dozen-Adams

d. Lanyards, each:

$0.48

$0.54

Total for 140:

$67.20

$75.60
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: H-26-13 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/01/13

Bidder:

Riddell/All American, 669
Sugar Lane, Elyria, OH
44035-6309

The Player's Connection of
Florida LLC, 12900 West
State Road 84, Davie, FL
33325

Manufacturer/style number bid:

Ath. Spec. LANR

Adams-670 in dozen

e. Shoulder Pad Laces, each: $0.15 $0.15

Total for 200: $30.00 $30.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Riddell Adams-SPL

f. Pylon Markers, each: $5.00 $30.00

Total for 12: $60.00 $360.00
Riddell RWAP (sold insets

Manufacturer/style number bid: of 4) Fisher set of 4

g.Yard Markers, per set: $86.00 $274.80

Total for 2: $172.00 $549.60

Manufacturer/style number bid: Athletic Specialties/SYM Fisher-SLMTDR

h. Down Markers, per set: $97.65 $117.60

Total for 1: $97.65 $117.60

Manufacturer/style number bid: Riddell RFDMRC Fisher-F2003

TOTAL ITEM 9 (a-h): $1,049.45 $1,583.80

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 4 (ITEMS 1-

9)

$16,955.34

Incomplete bid for Group,
cannot be considered per
Section | -
Specifications/Special
Conditions, C. Bid_
Items/Grouping
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: H-26-13 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/01/13

Bidder:

Riddell/All American, 669
Sugar Lane, Elyria, OH
44035-6309

The Player's Connection of
Florida LLC, 12900 West
State Road 84, Davie, FL
33325

Group 4 delivery time a.r.o., no later
than 6-18-13:

30 calendar days

30 calendar days

Acknowledged addenda?

yes, 1 &2

yes, 1 &2

Notes:
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