
CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID  TABULATION

Bid #:  T-36-13  Title:  Mulch, Cooperative Bid

Date 7/8/13

Bidder:

Advanced Mulch Inc, P.O. 

Box 32943, Palm Beach 

Gardens, FL 33420

Amerigrow Recycling - 

Delray, L.P., 10320 W. 

Atlantic Avenue, Delray 

Beach, FL 33446

Eastcoast Mulch, P.O. 

Box 1352, Jupiter FL 

33468

Landscape Products, Inc, 

1208 NW 10th Ave, 

Okeechobee, FL 34972

1., Mulch, red, delivered in bulk, 

per CY: no bid $17.00 no bid $15.50
Total for 13,750 cy: no bid $233,750.00 no bid $213,125.00
# of yards per truckload  100 yards  100 cubic yards
minimum order  100 yards  100 cubic yards

2., Mulch, brown, delivered in 

bulk, per cy: no bid $17.00 no bid $15.50
Total for 4,395 CY: no bid $74,715.00 no bid $68,122.50
# of yards per truckload  100 yards  100 cubic yards
minimum order  100 yards  100 cubic yards

3., Mulch,  red, delivered in bags, 

per bag: no bid $1.70 no bid $1.50
Total for 8,800 bag: no bid $14,960.00 no bid $13,200.00
# of bags per pallet  75 bags  80 bags
minimum order  1650 bags  1440 bags

4., Mulch, brown, delivered in 

bags, per bag: no bid $1.70 no bid $1.50
Total for 12,400 bag: no bid $21,080.00 no bid $18,600.00
# of bags per pallet  75 bags  80 bags
minimum order  1650 bags  1440 bags

5., Mulch, red, bulk, installed, per 

CY: $23.95 $28.00 $23.00 $32.00
Total for 8,120 CY: $194,474.00 $227,360.00 $186,760.00 $259,840.00
minimum order 20 cubic yards 30 cubic yards n/a 60 cubic yards

6., Mulch, brown, bulk, installed, 

per cy: $23.95 $27.00 $23.00 $32.00
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID  TABULATION

Bid #:  T-36-13  Title:  Mulch, Cooperative Bid

Date 7/8/13

Bidder:

1., Mulch, red, delivered in bulk, 

per CY:
Total for 13,750 cy:
# of yards per truckload
minimum order

2., Mulch, brown, delivered in 

bulk, per cy:
Total for 4,395 CY:
# of yards per truckload
minimum order

3., Mulch,  red, delivered in bags, 

per bag:
Total for 8,800 bag:
# of bags per pallet
minimum order

4., Mulch, brown, delivered in 

bags, per bag:
Total for 12,400 bag:
# of bags per pallet
minimum order

5., Mulch, red, bulk, installed, per 

CY:
Total for 8,120 CY:
minimum order

6., Mulch, brown, bulk, installed, 

per cy:

Forestry Resources Inc, 

4353 Michigan Link, Fort 

Myers, FL 33916

FIS Outdoor Inc, 5320 

NW 10th Terr, FT Laud, 

FL 33309

Superior Mulch, 9621 S.R. 

#7, Boynton Beach, FL 

33472

The Fibar Group, LLC, 80 

Business Park Dr, Ste 

300, Armonk, NY 10504

$22.29 $15.48 $16.24 $35.95
$306,487.50 $212,850.00 $223,300.00 $494,312.50

80 cubic yards 100 cubic yards 100 cubic yards 80 cubic yards
80 cubic yards 100 cubic yards 100 cubic yards 1 Truckload

$17.04 $15.98 $16.50 $26.95
$74,890.80 $70,232.10 $72,517.50 $118,445.25

80 cubic yards 100 cubic yards 100 cubic yards 80 cubic yards
80 cubic yards 100 cubic yards 100 cubic yards 1 Truckload

$2.03 $1.59 $1.49 $3.45
$17,864.00 $13,992.00 $13,112.00 $30,360.00

70 bags 80 bags 80 bags 1260 bags
1260 bags 1600 bags 1600 bags 1 Truckload (18 pallets)

$2.03 $1.59 $1.49 $2.88
$25,172.00 $19,716.00 $18,476.00 $35,712.00

70 bags 80 bags 80 bags 1260 bags
1260 bags 1600 bags 1600 bags 1 Truckload (18 pallets)

$34.24 no bid no bid $48.20
$278,028.80 no bid no bid $391,384.00

65 cubic yards  20 yards
1 Truckload

$30.00 no bid no bid $39.27
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID  TABULATION

Bid #:  T-36-13  Title:  Mulch, Cooperative Bid

Date 7/8/13

Bidder:

Advanced Mulch Inc, P.O. 

Box 32943, Palm Beach 

Gardens, FL 33420

Amerigrow Recycling - 

Delray, L.P., 10320 W. 

Atlantic Avenue, Delray 

Beach, FL 33446

Eastcoast Mulch, P.O. 

Box 1352, Jupiter FL 

33468

Landscape Products, Inc, 

1208 NW 10th Ave, 

Okeechobee, FL 34972
Total for 2,470 cy: $59,156.50 $66,690.00 $56,810.00 $79,040.00
minimum order 20 yards 30 cubic yards n/a 60 cubic yards

7., Mulch, melaleuca, delivered in 

bulk, per CY: no bid $16.00 no bid no bid
Total for 120 cy: no bid $1,920.00 no bid no bid
# of yards per truckload  100 cubic yards   
minimum order  100 cubic yards   

8., Mulch, melaleuca, delivered in 

bags, per bag: no bid $1.60 no bid no bid
Total for 5,760 bags: no bid $9,216.00 no bid no bid
# of bags per pallet  75 bags   
minimum order  1650 bags   

9., Mulch, rubber, delivered in 

bags, per super sack: no bid no bid no bid no bid
Total for 10 super sack: no bid no bid no bid no bid
minimum order  

10., Playground Safety Wood 

Chips, delivered in bulk, per cy: no bid $31.00 no bid $19.00
Total for 1,200 cy: no bid $37,200.00 no bid $22,800.00
# of yards per truckload 100 cubic yards 100 cubic yards
minimum order 100 cubic yards 100 cubic yards

11., Playground Safety Wood 

Chips, installed, per cy: $30.85 $42.00 $32.00 $38.00
Total for 1,300 cy: $40,105.00 $54,600.00 $41,600.00 $49,400.00
minimum order 20 cubic yards 30 cubic yards n/a 60 cubic yards
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID  TABULATION

Bid #:  T-36-13  Title:  Mulch, Cooperative Bid

Date 7/8/13

Bidder:
Total for 2,470 cy:
minimum order

7., Mulch, melaleuca, delivered in 

bulk, per CY:
Total for 120 cy:
# of yards per truckload
minimum order

8., Mulch, melaleuca, delivered in 

bags, per bag:
Total for 5,760 bags:
# of bags per pallet
minimum order

9., Mulch, rubber, delivered in 

bags, per super sack:
Total for 10 super sack:
minimum order

10., Playground Safety Wood 

Chips, delivered in bulk, per cy:
Total for 1,200 cy:
# of yards per truckload
minimum order

11., Playground Safety Wood 

Chips, installed, per cy:
Total for 1,300 cy:
minimum order

Forestry Resources Inc, 

4353 Michigan Link, Fort 

Myers, FL 33916

FIS Outdoor Inc, 5320 

NW 10th Terr, FT Laud, 

FL 33309

Superior Mulch, 9621 S.R. 

#7, Boynton Beach, FL 

33472

The Fibar Group, LLC, 80 

Business Park Dr, Ste 

300, Armonk, NY 10504
$74,100.00 no bid no bid $96,996.90

65 cubic yards  1 Truckload

$17.00 no bid $15.00 $23.64
$2,040.00 no bid $1,800.00 $2,836.80

60 yards 100 cubic yards 80 cubic yards
60 yards 100 cubic yards 1 Truckload

$1.68 $1.99 $1.50 $2.48
$9,676.80 $11,462.40 $8,640.00 $14,284.80

70 bags 80 bags 80 bags 1,260 bags per pallet
1260 bags 1600 bags 1600 bags 1 Truckload (18 pallets)

no bid $465.00 no bid $844.00
no bid $4,650.00 no bid $8,440.00
 10 sacks 1 super sack

$17.30 $29.99 $22.95 $32.50
$20,760.00 $35,988.00 $27,540.00 $39,000.00

80 yards 100 cubic yards 85 cubic yards 100 cubic yards
80 yards 100 cubic yards 85 cubic yards 1 Truckload

$25.30 no bid no bid $48.20
$32,890.00 no bid no bid $62,660.00

65 cubic yards  1 Truckload
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID  TABULATION

Bid #:  T-36-13  Title:  Mulch, Cooperative Bid

Date 7/8/13

Bidder:

Advanced Mulch Inc, P.O. 

Box 32943, Palm Beach 

Gardens, FL 33420

Amerigrow Recycling - 

Delray, L.P., 10320 W. 

Atlantic Avenue, Delray 

Beach, FL 33446

Eastcoast Mulch, P.O. 

Box 1352, Jupiter FL 

33468

Landscape Products, Inc, 

1208 NW 10th Ave, 

Okeechobee, FL 34972
12., Fibar Engineered Wood 

Fiber, bulk, per cy: no bid no bid no bid no bid
Total for 100 cy: no bid no bid no bid no bid
# of yards delivered per truckload  
minimum order  

13., Fibar Engineered Wood 

Fiber, installed, per cy: no bid no bid $35.00 no bid
Total for 500 cy: no bid no bid $17,500.00 no bid
 minimum order 100 cubic yards  

Bulk/Bagged Delivery time a.r.o.: n/a 3 calendar days n/a 3  calendar days

Installed Delivery time a.r.o. 5 calendar days 7 calendar days 3 calendar days 14 calendar days

Notes: Bidder states that unit 

prices provided in the Bid 

will remain the same for 

items 5 and 6.

 Bidder did not state 

minimum orders for items 

5,  6, and 11

Bidder states that unit 

prices provided in the Bid 

will remain the same for 

items 1,2, 5 and 6.
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID  TABULATION

Bid #:  T-36-13  Title:  Mulch, Cooperative Bid

Date 7/8/13

Bidder:
12., Fibar Engineered Wood 

Fiber, bulk, per cy:
Total for 100 cy:
# of yards delivered per truckload
minimum order

13., Fibar Engineered Wood 

Fiber, installed, per cy:
Total for 500 cy:
 minimum order

Bulk/Bagged Delivery time a.r.o.:

Installed Delivery time a.r.o.

Notes:

Forestry Resources Inc, 

4353 Michigan Link, Fort 

Myers, FL 33916

FIS Outdoor Inc, 5320 

NW 10th Terr, FT Laud, 

FL 33309

Superior Mulch, 9621 S.R. 

#7, Boynton Beach, FL 

33472

The Fibar Group, LLC, 80 

Business Park Dr, Ste 

300, Armonk, NY 10504

$22.55 no bid $29.71 $32.50
$2,255.00 no bid $2,971.00 $3,250.00

100 yards 85 cubic yards 100 cubic yards
100 yards 85 cubic yards 1 Truckload

$40.50 no bid no bid $48.20
$20,250.00 no bid no bid $24,100.00

65 cubic yards  1 Truckload

3-5 calendar days 2-4 calendar days 2 calendar days 10 calendar days

7-10 calendar days n/a n/a 14 calendar days

Bidder states that unit 

prices provided in the Bid 

will remain the same for 

items 1,2, 5 and 6.

Bidder states that unit 

prices provided in the Bid 

will remain the same for 

items 1,2, 5 and 6.
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