CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: E-32-14 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/28/14

BSN Sports Efinger Sporting Goods Co. |[Home Team Athletics Matty's Sports, Inc. Riddell S&S Worldwide

P.O. Box 49 513 W. Union Avenue 242 S. Wilmington Hwy. 7911 NW 72 Ave. Ste. 106 |669 Sugar Lane 75 Mill Street
Bidder: Jenkintown, PA 19046 Bound Brook, NJ 08805 Jacksonville, NC 28540 Miami, FL 33166 Elyria, OH 44035-8225 Colchester, Ct. 06415
GROUP 1 - GAME UNIFORMS no bid no bid
Sublimated Game Jerseys no bid no bid no bid
Size Youth X-Small, each: $44.50 $0.00 $59.20 $49.95 $0.00 $0.00
total for 35: $1,557.50 $0.00 $2,072.00 $1,748.25 $0.00 $0.00
Size Youth Small, each $44.50 $0.00 $59.20 $49.95 $0.00 $0.00
total for 85: $3,782.50 $0.00 $5,032.00 $4,245.75 $0.00 $0.00
Size Youth Medium, each: $44.50 $0.00 $59.20 $49.95 $0.00 $0.00
total for 65: $2,892.50 $0.00 $3,848.00 $3,246.75 $0.00 $0.00
Size Youth Large, each $44.50 $0.00 $59.20 $49.95 $0.00 $0.00
total for 80 $3,560.00 $0.00 $4,736.00 $3,996.00 $0.00 $0.00
Size for Youth X-Large, each: $44.50 $0.00 $59.20 $49.95 $0.00 $0.00
total for 20 $890.00 $0.00 $1,184.00 $999.00 $0.00 $0.00
Size Adult X-Small, each: $46.50 $0.00 $59.20 $49.95 $0.00 $0.00
total for 10: $465.00 $0.00 $592.00 $499.50 $0.00 $0.00
Size Adult Small, each $46.50 $0.00 $59.20 $54.95 $0.00 $0.00
total for 55: $2,557.50 $0.00 $3,256.00 $3,022.25 $0.00 $0.00
Size Adult Medium, each: $46.50 $0.00 $59.20 $54.95 $0.00 $0.00
total for 45: $2,092.50 $0.00 $2,664.00 $2,472.75 $0.00 $0.00
Size Adult Large, each $46.50 $0.00 $59.20 $54.95 $0.00 $0.00
total for 15 $697.50 $0.00 $888.00 $824.25 $0.00 $0.00
Game jersey, Manufacturer/style AGAME Team (Pro)
number bid: Champro FJ14Y & FJ14A Custom Matty's Sports MSFBJ
Fully Integrated Game Pants no bid no bid
Size Youth X-Small, each: $18.50 $0.00 $24.65 $15.49 $22.70 $0.00
Total for 35: $647.50 $0.00 $862.75 $542.15 $794.50 $0.00
Size Youth Small, each: $18.50 $0.00 $24.65 $15.49 $22.70 $0.00
Total for 75: $1,387.50 $0.00 $1,848.75 $1,161.75 $1,702.50 $0.00
Size Youth Medium, each: $18.50 $0.00 $24.65 $15.49 $22.70 $0.00
Total for 75: $1,387.50 $0.00 $1,848.75 $1,161.75 $1,702.50 $0.00
Size Youth Large, each: $18.50 $0.00 $24.65 $15.49 $22.70 $0.00
Total for 54: $999.00 $0.00 $1,331.10 $836.46 $1,225.80 $0.00
Size Youth X-Large, each: $18.50 $0.00 $24.65 $15.49 $22.70 $0.00
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: E-32-14 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/28/14

BSN Sports Efinger Sporting Goods Co. |[Home Team Athletics Matty's Sports, Inc. Riddell S&S Worldwide
P.O. Box 49 513 W. Union Avenue 242 S. Wilmington Hwy. 7911 NW 72 Ave. Ste. 106 |669 Sugar Lane 75 Mill Street

Bidder: Jenkintown, PA 19046 Bound Brook, NJ 08805 Jacksonville, NC 28540 Miami, FL 33166 Elyria, OH 44035-8225 Colchester, Ct. 06415
Total for 76: $1,406.00 $0.00 $1,873.40 $1,177.24 $1,725.20 $0.00
Size Adult Small, each: $20.95 $0.00 $24.65 $17.49 $22.70 $0.00
Total for 50: $1,047.50 $0.00 $1,232.50 $874.50 $1,135.00 $0.00
Size Adult Medium, each: $20.95 $0.00 $24.65 $17.49 $22.70 $0.00
Total for 20: $419.00 $0.00 $493.00 $349.80 $454.00 $0.00
Size Adult Large, each: $20.95 $0.00 $24.65 $17.49 $22.70 $0.00
Total for 15: $314.25 $0.00 $369.75 $262.35 $340.50 $0.00
Manufacturer/style number bid: Champro FPYU9 & FPAU9 Teamwork Fusion Riddell YGPW

Incomplete bid for Group,

cannot be considered per

Section | -

Specifications/Special

Conditions, C. Bid
GRAND TOTAL GROUP 1 $26,103.25 $0.00 $34,132.00 $27,420.50|ltems/Grouping $0.00
Group 1 delivery time a.r.o., no later
than 7-31-13: 30 calendar days 30 calendar days 30 calendar days 28 calendar days 45 calendar days
GROUP 2 - PRACTICE PANTS, Game
On, or equal no bid no bid
Youth X-Small size, each: $0.00 $13.80 $21.27 $13.49 $9.66 $0.00
Total for 125: $0.00 $1,725.00 $2,658.75 $1,686.25 $1,207.50 $0.00
Youth Small size, each: $0.00 $13.80 $21.27 $13.49 $9.66 $0.00
Total for 85: $0.00 $1,173.00 $1,807.95 $1,146.65 $821.10 $0.00
Youth Medium size, each: $0.00 $13.80 $21.27 $13.49 $9.66 $0.00
Total for 70: $0.00 $966.00 $1,488.90 $944.30 $676.20 $0.00
Youth Large size, each: $0.00 $13.80 $21.27 $13.49 $9.66 $0.00
Total for 55 : $0.00 $759.00 $1,169.85 $741.95 $531.30 $0.00
Youth X-Large size, each: $0.00 $13.80 $21.27 $13.49 $9.66 $0.00
Total for 55: $0.00 $759.00 $1,169.85 $741.95 $531.30 $0.00
Adult X-Small size, each: $0.00 |no bid $21.27 $16.95 $11.70 $0.00
Total for 50: $0.00|no bid $1,063.50 $847.50 $585.00 $0.00
Adult Small size, each: $0.00 $17.35 $21.27 $16.95 $11.70 $0.00
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: E-32-14 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/28/14

BSN Sports Efinger Sporting Goods Co. |[Home Team Athletics Matty's Sports, Inc. Riddell S&S Worldwide
P.O. Box 49 513 W. Union Avenue 242 S. Wilmington Hwy. 7911 NW 72 Ave. Ste. 106 |669 Sugar Lane 75 Mill Street

Bidder: Jenkintown, PA 19046 Bound Brook, NJ 08805 Jacksonville, NC 28540 Miami, FL 33166 Elyria, OH 44035-8225 Colchester, Ct. 06415
Total for 30: $0.00 $520.50 $638.10 $508.50 $351.00 $0.00
Adult Medium size, each: $0.00 $17.35 $21.27 $16.95 $11.70 $0.00
Total for 50 $0.00 $867.50 $1,063.50 $847.50 $585.00 $0.00
Adult Large size, each: $0.00 $17.35 $24.65 $16.95 $11.70 $0.00
Total for 30 $0.00 $520.50 $739.50 $508.50 $351.00 $0.00
Adult X-Large size, each: $0.00 $17.35 $24.65 $16.95 $11.70 $0.00
Total for 50 : $0.00 $867.50 $1,232.50 $847.50 $585.00 $0.00
Manufacturer/style number bid: Champro Intimidator A4 #NB6180 Champro/FPC Intimidator  |Riddell YPPW/PPW

Incomplete bid for Group,

cannot be considered per

Section | -

Specifications/Special

Conditions, C. Bid
GRAND TOTAL GROUP 2 $0.00|ltems/Grouping $13,032.40 $8,820.60 $6,224.40 $0.00
Group 2 delivery time a.r.o., no later
than 6-18-13: 30 calendar days 10 calendar days 30 calendar days 30 calendar days
GROUP 3 - SHOULDER PADS no bid
X-Small, as per specifications, each: $29.99 $31.90 $37.40 $24.50 $24.50 $0.00
Total for 90: $2,699.10 $2,871.00 $3,366.00 $2,205.00 $2,205.00 $0.00
Small, as per specifications, each: $30.99 $32.50 $39.17 $25.50 $25.50 $0.00
Total for 90: $2,789.10 $2,925.00 $3,525.30 $2,295.00 $2,295.00 $0.00
Medium, as per specifications, each: $34.99 $33.10 $44.19 $27.50 $27.00 $0.00
Total for 75: $2,624.25 $2,482.50 $3,314.25 $2,062.50 $2,025.00 $0.00
Large, as per specifications, each: $35.99 $34.25 $46.35 $29.50 $30.00 $0.00
Total for 45: $1,619.55 $1,541.25 $2,085.75 $1,327.50 $1,350.00 $0.00
X-Large, as per specifications, each: $37.99 $34.95 $49.15 $30.50 $31.00 $0.00
Total for 35: $1,329.65 $1,223.25 $1,720.25 $1,067.50 $1,085.00 $0.00
Manufacturer/style number bid: Gear Air Tech Jr 1377130 |Gear Air Tech CHAMPRO AIR TECH 3.3 Riddell #48096 Warrior 11X
GRAND TOTAL GROUP 3 $11,061.65 $11,043.00 $14,011.55 $8,957.50 $8,960.00 $0.00
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: E-32-14 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/28/14

Bidder:

BSN Sports
P.O. Box 49

Jenkintown, PA 19046

Efinger Sporting Goods Co.
513 W. Union Avenue
Bound Brook, NJ 08805

Home Team Athletics
242 S. Wilmington Hwy.
Jacksonville, NC 28540

Matty's Sports, Inc.
7911 NW 72 Ave. Ste. 106
Miami, FL 33166

Riddell
669 Sugar Lane
Elyria, OH 44035-8225

S&S Worldwide
75 Mill Street
Colchester, Ct. 06415

Group 3 delivery time a.r.o., no later
than 6-18-13:

14 calendar days

18 calendar days

10 calendar days

30 calendar days

GROUP 4 - FOOTBALL EQUIPMENT

ITEM 1, HELMETS, Riddell
Revolution Attack Youth Helmet, or

equal no bid no bid

X-Small, each: $0.00 $72.59 $74.80 $59.95 $51.99 $0.00
total for 95: $0.00 $6,896.05 $7,106.00 $5,695.25 $4,939.05 $0.00
Small, each: $0.00 $72.59 $74.80 $59.95 $51.99 $0.00
total for 85: $0.00 $6,170.15 $6,358.00 $5,095.75 $4,419.15 $0.00
Medium, each: $0.00 $72.59 $74.80 $59.95 $51.99 $0.00
total for 80: $0.00 $5,807.20 $5,984.00 $4,796.00 $4,159.20 $0.00
Large, each: $0.00 $72.59 $74.80 $59.95 $51.99 $0.00
total for 35: $0.00 $2,540.65 $2,618.00 $2,098.25 $1,819.65 $0.00
X-Large, each: $0.00 $72.59 $74.80 $59.95 $51.99 $0.00
total for 25: $0.00 $1,814.75 $1,870.00 $1,498.75 $1,299.75 $0.00
Manufacturer/style number bid: Rawling NRG Momentum + |Shutt Air Standard Il Schutt 7976 Riddell Attack/Edge (Adult)

TOTAL ITEM 1: $0.00 $23,228.80 $23,936.00 $19,184.00 $16,636.80 $0.00
ITEM 2, FOOTBALLS Eliminated from bid Eliminated from bid Eliminated from bid Eliminated from bid Eliminated from bid Eliminated from bid

K2, each: $0-00 $0-00 $0.00 $0.00 $0-60 $0.00
total for 80: $0-00 $0-00 $0.00 $0.00 $0-60 $0.00
TDK, each: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $6.00 $0.00 $6.00
total for 45: $0-00 $0-00 $0.00 $0.00 $0-60 $0.00
TDY, each: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $6.00 $0.00 $6.00
total for 45: $0-00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Manufacturer/style number bid:

Eliminated from bid

Eliminated from bid

Eliminated from bid

Eliminated from bid

Eliminated from bid

Eliminated from bid
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: E-32-14 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/28/14

BSN Sports Efinger Sporting Goods Co. |[Home Team Athletics Matty's Sports, Inc. Riddell S&S Worldwide

P.O. Box 49 513 W. Union Avenue 242 S. Wilmington Hwy. 7911 NW 72 Ave. Ste. 106 |669 Sugar Lane 75 Mill Street
Bidder: Jenkintown, PA 19046 Bound Brook, NJ 08805 Jacksonville, NC 28540 Miami, FL 33166 Elyria, OH 44035-8225 Colchester, Ct. 06415
TOTAL ITEM 2: $0-00 $0-00 $0-00 $0-00 $0.00 $0.00
ITEM 3, JAW PADS no bid no bid
Small, each: $0.00 $2.70 $3.98 $2.50 $1.10 $0.00
total for 125: $0.00 $337.50 $497.50 $312.50 $137.50 $0.00
Medium, each: $0.00 $2.70 $3.98 $2.50 $1.10 $0.00
total for 125: $0.00 $337.50 $497.50 $312.50 $137.50 $0.00
Large, each: $0.00 $10.50 $7.16 $2.50 $5.00 $0.00
total for 50: $0.00 $525.00 $358.00 $125.00 $250.00 $0.00
X-Large, each: $0.00 $10.50 $7.16 $2.50 $5.00 $0.00
total for 50: $0.00 $525.00 $358.00 $125.00 $250.00 $0.00
Manufacturer/style number bid: Athletic Specilaties JPM Adams B1 Athletic Specialties / JPM Riddell 45727/45750
TOTAL ITEM 3: $0.00 $1,725.00 $1,711.00 $875.00 $775.00 $0.00
ITEM 4, CHIN STRAPS no bid no bid
Youth, high hook up, each: $0.00 $4.75 $12.20 $2.95 $2.90 $0.00
Total for 200: $0.00 $950.00 $2,440.00 $590.00 $580.00 $0.00
Youth, low hook up, each: $0.00 $4.70 $12.20 $2.95 $2.90 $0.00
Total for 150: $0.00 $705.00 $1,830.00 $442.50 $435.00 $0.00
Adult, low hook up, each: $0.00 $4.70 $12.20 $3.95 $2.90 $0.00
Total for 100: $0.00 $470.00 $1,220.00 $395.00 $290.00 $0.00
Manufacturer/style number bid: Athletic Specialties Adams Pro-25 4D Athletic Specialties/YCS Riddell 45767 & 45747
TOTAL ITEM 4: $0.00 $2,125.00 $5,490.00 $1,427.50 $1,305.00 $0.00
ITEM 5, KEYWAY HOOKS no bid no bid
1", each: $0.00 $0.25 $0.38 $0.25 $0.30 $0.00
Total for 100: $0.00 $25.00 $38.00 $25.00 $30.00 $0.00
1-1/2", each: $0.00 $0.30 $0.64 $0.25 $0.30 $0.00
Total for 100: $0.00 $30.00 $64.00 $25.00 $30.00 $0.00
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: E-32-14 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/28/14

BSN Sports Efinger Sporting Goods Co. |[Home Team Athletics Matty's Sports, Inc. Riddell S&S Worldwide

P.O. Box 49 513 W. Union Avenue 242 S. Wilmington Hwy. 7911 NW 72 Ave. Ste. 106 |669 Sugar Lane 75 Mill Street
Bidder: Jenkintown, PA 19046 Bound Brook, NJ 08805 Jacksonville, NC 28540 Miami, FL 33166 Elyria, OH 44035-8225 Colchester, Ct. 06415
Manufacturer/style number bid: Athletic Specialties Adams SPH Athletic Specialties Riddell 1204 & 1207
TOTAL ITEM 5: $0.00 $55.00 $102.00 $50.00 $60.00 $0.00
ITEM 6, "T" HOOKS no bid no bid
1", each: $0.00 $0.30 $0.65 $0.40 $0.30 $0.00
Total for 250: $0.00 $75.00 $162.50 $100.00 $75.00 $0.00
1-1/2", each: $0.00 $0.35 $0.65 $0.40 $0.30 $0.00
Total for 250: $0.00 $87.50 $162.50 $100.00 $75.00 $0.00
Manufacturer/style number bid: Athletics Specialties Adams SPH Athletic Specialties Riddell 1208 & 1219
TOTAL ITEM 6: $0.00 $162.50 $325.00 $200.00 $150.00 $0.00
ITEM 7, TRAINER TAPE no bid no bid
1", Black, per box: $0.00 $162.75 $65.48 $42.00 $65.00 $0.00
Total for 6: $0.00 $976.50 $392.88 $252.00 $390.00 $0.00
1-1/2", White, per box: $0.00 $48.25 $70.20 $42.00 $48.00 $0.00
Total for 4: $0.00 $193.00 $280.80 $168.00 $192.00 $0.00
Manufacturer/style number bid: Jay bird, Coaches Choice  |Mueller M Tape Athletic Specialties Riddell 60202
TOTAL ITEM 7: $0.00 $1,169.50 $673.68 $420.00 $582.00 $0.00
ITEM 8, ELASTIC STRAP no bid no bid
1", Black, per roll: $0.00 $26.25 $21.75 $19.95 $22.00 $0.00
Total for 8: $0.00 $210.00 $174.00 $159.60 $176.00 $0.00
1-1/2", White, per roll: $0.00 $36.25 $26.82 $24.95 $25.00 $0.00
Total for 8: $0.00 $290.00 $214.56 $199.60 $200.00 $0.00
Manufacturer/style number bid: Athletic Specialties Adams SPE Athletic Specialties Riddell
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: E-32-14 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/28/14

BSN Sports Efinger Sporting Goods Co. |[Home Team Athletics Matty's Sports, Inc. Riddell S&S Worldwide

P.O. Box 49 513 W. Union Avenue 242 S. Wilmington Hwy. 7911 NW 72 Ave. Ste. 106 |669 Sugar Lane 75 Mill Street
Bidder: Jenkintown, PA 19046 Bound Brook, NJ 08805 Jacksonville, NC 28540 Miami, FL 33166 Elyria, OH 44035-8225 Colchester, Ct. 06415
TOTAL ITEM 8: $0.00 $500.00 $388.56 $359.20 $376.00 $0.00
ITEM 9, MISCELLANEOUS no bid no bid
a. Belts, black, each: $0.00 $0.85 $1.35 $0.90 $0.73 $0.00
Total for 120 $0.00 $102.00 $162.00 $108.00 $87.60 $0.00
Manufacturer/style number bid: ProSport FB-BLT Champion FFB3 Athletic Specialties Riddell WB52
b. Mouth Pieces, each: $0.00 $0.30 $0.48 $0.39 $0.36 $0.00
Total for 1000: $0.00 $300.00 $480.00 $390.00 $360.00 $0.00
Manufacturer/style number bid: Adams MG301 Adams YMG-304 Athletic Specialties Riddell 45791
c. Whistles, each: $0.00 $0.30 $0.50 $1.25 $1.25 $0.32
Total for 275: $0.00 $82.50 $137.50 $343.75 $343.75 $88.00
Manufacturer/style number bid: Champion #601 Champion #601 Athletic Specialties Ath. Specialties PLC S & S Spectrum W5896
d. Lanyards, each: $0.00 $0.25 $0.60 $0.60 $0.48 $0.24
Total for 275: $0.00 $68.75 $165.00 $165.00 $132.00 $66.00
Manufacturer/style number bid: ProSport LYNDB Champion #126 Athletic Specialties Ath. Spec. LANR S & S Spectrum W9455
e. Shoulder Pad Laces, each: $0.00 $0.17 $0.23 $0.19 $0.15 $0.00
Total for 200: $0.00 $34.00 $46.00 $38.00 $30.00 $0.00
Manufacturer/style number bid: Athletic Specialties SYB Adams #SPL Athletic Specialties/SPL Riddell
f. Pylon Markers, each: $0.00 $10.50 $9.80 $5.95 $5.00 $0.00
Total for 12: $0.00 $126.00 $117.60 $71.40 $60.00 $0.00

Riddell RWAP (sold insets

Manufacturer/style number bid: Champion #FPYL Champion #FPYL Athletic Specialties/SFW of 4) no bid
g.Yard Markers, per set: $0.00 $257.00 $222.78 $79.95 $86.00 $0.00
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: E-32-14 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/28/14

BSN Sports
P.O. Box 49

Efinger Sporting Goods Co.
513 W. Union Avenue

Home Team Athletics
242 S. Wilmington Hwy.

Matty's Sports, Inc.
7911 NW 72 Ave. Ste. 106

Riddell
669 Sugar Lane

S&S Worldwide
75 Mill Street

Bidder: Jenkintown, PA 19046 Bound Brook, NJ 08805 Jacksonville, NC 28540 Miami, FL 33166 Elyria, OH 44035-8225 Colchester, Ct. 06415

Total for 2: $0.00 $514.00 $445.56 $159.90 $172.00 $0.00
Manufacturer/style number bid: Champion #SLM Champion #SLMPRO Athletic Specialties/SYM Athletic Specialties/SYM no bid

h. Down Markers, per set: $0.00 $337.50 $339.00 $149.00 $97.65 $0.00
Total for 3: $0.00 $1,012.50 $1,017.00 $447.00 $292.95 $0.00
Manufacturer/style number bid: Champion DCX Champion A103 Athletic Specialties #LSI Riddell RFDMRC

i. Kick-Off Tees, each: $0.00 $1.75 $2.50 $2.95 $3.25 $1.60
Total for 36: $0.00 $63.00 $90.00 $106.20 $117.00 $57.60
Manufacturer/style number bid: ProSport KT-2 Champion KT1 Athletic Specialties/SPL Riddell 27541 Spectrum W4299

j- Extra Point Tees, each: $0.00 $1.75 $3.57 $2.95 $3.25 $0.00
Total for 30: $0.00 $52.50 $107.10 $88.50 $97.50 $0.00
Manufacturer/style number bid: ProSport PK-2 Chanpion KT3 Athletic Specialties/SFW Riddell 27540

k. Helmet Hardware: FGRS (small) set: $0.00 $3.15 $7.18 $3.65 $3.63 $0.00
Total for 50: $0.00 $157.50 $359.00 $182.50 $181.50 $0.00
Manufacturer/style number bid: Athletic Specialties FGRS |Adams #HHK-22 Athletic Specialties/SYM Athletic Specialties FGRS

I. Helmet Hardware: FGAG (large), set: $0.00 $3.15 $7.18 $3.65 $3.63 $0.00
Total for 50: $0.00 $157.50 $359.00 $182.50 $181.50 $0.00
Manufacturer/style number bid: Athletic Specialties FGAG |Adams #HHK-22 Athletic Specialties #LSI Athletic Specialties FGAG

TOTAL ITEM 9 (a-1): $0.00 $2,670.25 $3,485.76 $2,282.75 $2,055.80 $211.60
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION
Bid #: E-32-14 Title: Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 4/28/14

Bidder:

BSN Sports
P.O. Box 49

Jenkintown, PA 19046

Efinger Sporting Goods Co.
513 W. Union Avenue
Bound Brook, NJ 08805

Home Team Athletics
242 S. Wilmington Hwy.
Jacksonville, NC 28540

Matty's Sports, Inc.
7911 NW 72 Ave. Ste. 106
Miami, FL 33166

Riddell
669 Sugar Lane
Elyria, OH 44035-8225

S&S Worldwide
75 Mill Street
Colchester, Ct. 06415

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 4 (ITEMS 1-
9)

$0.00

$31,636.05

$36,112.00

$24,798.45

$21,940.60

Incomplete bid for Group,
cannot be considered per
Section | -
Specifications/Special
Conditions, C. Bid
ltems/Grouping

Group 4 delivery time a.r.o., no later
than 6-18-13:

30 calendar days

10 calendar days

30 calendar days

30 calendar days

5-7 calendar days

Acknowledged addenda?

yes, 1

no

yes, 1 &2

no

yes, 1 &2

yes, 1 &2

Notes:

Group 4-ltem 2 eliminated
from bid.

Group 4-ltem 9h corrected
for tabulation. Group 4-item
2 eliminated from bid.

Totals for Group 1-Game
Pants Adult Small size, and
Group 4-ltem 4 were
corrected for tabulation.
Group 4-ltem 2 eliminated
from bid.

Group 4-Item 2 eliminated
from bid.
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