
CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION

Bid #:  E-46-14  Title:  Blue Latex Exam Gloves

 Date: 05/20/14

Bidder:

CPR Savers & First Aid 

Supply, 7904 E. 

Chaparral Rd. Ste A110-

242, Scottsdale, Az. 

85250

Henry Schein Inc.

P.O. Box 3227 

Irmo, SC 29063

Midwest Medical Supply

13400 Lakefront Drive

Earth City, MO 63045

Moore Medical LLC

1690 New Britain Ave.

Farmington, CT 06032

P H & S Products LLC, 

310 South Grant St., 

Minerva, OH 44657

Group 1

1., Glove, exam, blue, 

latex, L, box of 50, per 

box: $20.15 $27.84 $15.41 $290.00 $9.20

total for 160 boxes: $3,224.00 $4,454.40 $2,465.60 $46,400.00 $1,472.00

Brand/part number: Tidi P2 BS0470-1 Tidi P2 BS0470-1 Tidi P2 BS0470-1 Tidi BS0470-1 Crew Blue 1LCBLG-L

Number boxes/case: 20 boxes/case 20 boxes/case 20 boxes/case 20 boxes/case 10 boxes/case

2., Glove, exam, blue, 

latex, XL, box of 50, per 

box: $20.15 $27.84 $15.41 $290.00 $9.20

total for 1,500 boxes: $30,225.00 $41,760.00 $23,115.00 $435,000.00 $13,800.00

Total For Group 1 $33,449.00 $46,214.40 $25,580.60 $481,400.00 $15,272.00

Brand/part number:
Tidi P2 BS0480-1 Tidi P2 BS0480-1 Tidi P2 BS0480-1 Tidi BS0480-1 Crew Blue 1LCBLG-XL

Number boxes/case: 20 boxes/case 20 boxes/case 20 boxes/case 20 boxes/case 10 boxes/case

Group 2

1., Glove, exam, blue, 

latex, XXL, box of 50, per 

box: $20.68 Non-Responsive No bid No bid $9.20

total for 125 boxes: $2,585.00 Non-Responsive No bid No bid $1,150.00

Total for Group 2 $2,585.00 Non-Responsive No bid No bid $1,150.00

Delivery time a.r.o.: 30 calendar days 3 calendar days 3 calendar days 2 calendar days 3 calendar days

Notes:

"P2 SafetyPlus 

Powderfree"

Unapproved alternates 

will not be considered for 

award, per the bid 

specifications *

"P2 SafetyPlus 

Powderfree" "Crew Blue"
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION

Bid #:  E-46-14  Title:  Blue Latex Exam Gloves

 Date: 05/20/14

Bidder:

Group 1

1., Glove, exam, blue, 

latex, L, box of 50, per 

box:

total for 160 boxes:

Brand/part number:

Number boxes/case:

2., Glove, exam, blue, 

latex, XL, box of 50, per 

box:

total for 1,500 boxes:

Total For Group 1

Brand/part number:

Number boxes/case:

Group 2

1., Glove, exam, blue, 

latex, XXL, box of 50, per 

box:

total for 125 boxes:

Total for Group 2

Delivery time a.r.o.:

Notes:

R&S First Response 

Supplies, 35 Montgomery 

St., Ste. 16G, New York, 

NY 10002

The Tools Man Industrial

5500 SW 48th St. Ste. B

Davie FL 33314

Veterans4You LLC, 1245 

S. Powerline Rd., Suite 

321, Pompano Beach, FL 

33069

$13.42 $10.25 $7.53

$2,147.20 $1,640.00 $1,204.80

P2 SafetyPlus NERA 

approved Tidi P2 BS0470-1 Medgluv 1215

20 boxes/case 20 boxes/case 10 boxes/case

$13.42 $10.25 $7.21

$20,130.00 $15,375.00 $10,815.00

$22,277.20 $17,015.00 $12,019.80

P2 SafetyPlus NFPA 

approved Tidi P2 BS0480-1 Medgluv 1215

20 boxes/case 20 boxes/case 10 boxes/case

$11.55 No bid $7.53

$1,443.75 No bid $941.25

$1,443.75 No bid $941.25

10 calendar days 7 calendar days 3 calendar days

"P2 SafetyPlus 

Powderfree"

"P2 SafetyPlus 

Powderfree"

"TuffSkin XP PF 44/bx." 

Total value for Group 2 

was corrected for 

tabulation.

*For Group 2, Henry 

Schein provided bid 

pricing for unapproved 

Dash Hi Risk Nitrile
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