
CITY OF POMPANO BEACH QUOTE TABULATION -Q-14-013T

TENNIS COURT SUPPLIES

FEBRUARY 18, 2014

Bidders:

BSN Sports, 6545 

Nova Drive, Ste 206, 

Davie, Fl  33317

Fast-Dry Corporation 

D/B/A 10-S Tennis 

Supply, 1400 NW 13th 

Avenue, Pompano Beach  

Fl  33069

Item #1    

Tidi Cooler/Igloo 5 gal. - Green/White

Unit Price $175.00 $47.03

Total 4 $700.00 $188.12

Item #2

Tidi Cooler Stand

Unit Price $120.00 $132.95

Total 4 $480.00 $531.80

Item #3

6'x54' Polypropylene, Leno Open-Dark

Green w/Bound Windows every 10'

Unit Price $1,100.00 $200.45

Total 6 $6,600.00 $1,202.70
Item #4    

6'x58' 1/2" Polypropylene, Leno Open Dark

w/Bound Windows every 10'

Unit Price $825.00 $213.45

Total 4 $3,300.00 $853.80

Item #5

7' Drag Broom w/Handle

Unit Price $190.00 $185.25

Total 1 $190.00 $185.25

Item #6

Black TieRaps, Standard (1000/bag)

Unit Price $38.00 $31.49

Total 16 bags $608.00 $503.86

Item #7

Rol-Dri Tidi Court Repl Trash Cans

Unit Price $20.00 $18.00

Total 6 $120.00 $108.00

Item #8

5' Extruded Green Poly Bench

Unit Price $225.00 $169.00

Total 4 $900.00 $676.00

Item #9

Black Plastic Snaps (100 bag)

Unit Price no bid $35.00

Total 5 bags  $175.00

Item #10

Nets, Edwards 40LS Double, Double Mesh

Top 5 Rows, Vinyl Headband, Fiberglass

Dowels or equal

Unit Price $200.00 $166.50

Total 6 $1,200.00 $999.00

Item #11

Master Linebroom Replacement

Brush Assemblies

Unit Price  $83.65

Total 2 no bid $167.30

Item #12

Polyethylene Rope 3/16"m 600'

Unit Price $30.00 $33.25

Total 2 $60.00 $66.50

Item #13

Floor Mounted Shoe Cleaner Replacement

Brushes

Unit Price  $22.80

Total 2 no bid $45.60

Item #14

EZ-Score Keepers

Unit Price $35.00 $29.40
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Total 5 bags $175.00 $147.00

Item #15

Double Snaps (Double End Anchor Clips)

Unit Price $2.50

Total 24 no bid $60.00

Item #16

Classic Net Strap (with Clip)

Unit Price $8.00 $7.95

Total 10 $80.00 $79.50

Item #17

Master Line Sweepers

Unit Price  $151.95

Total 2 no bid $303.90

Item #18

Pro Line Scrubber Replacement Brushes

Unit Price  $42.75

Total 4 no bid $171.00

Item #19

Miracle Sweep Roller

Unit Price $40.00 $66.45

Total 1 $40.00 $66.45

Item #20

Court Rake Raplacment Panels

Unit Price  $223.25

Total 2 no bid $446.50

Item #21

Miracle Sweep Replacement Roller

Unit Price $40.00 $27.55

Total 1 $40.00 $27.55

GRAND TOTAL: $14,493.00 $7,004.83

Delivery Time  1-2 business days
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