
CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID  TABULATION

Bid #:  E-19-16  Title:  Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 04/12/16

Bidder:

BSN Sports

P.O. Box 49

Jenkintown, PA  19046

Home Team Athletics

242 S. Wilmington Hwy.

Jacksonville, NC 28540

Matty's Sports, Inc.

7911 NW 72 Ave. Ste. 106

Miami, FL 33166

Riddell

669 Sugar Lane

Elyria, OH  44035-8225

Valley Athletics

11735 NE Sumner St.

Portland OR 97220

GROUP 1 - GAME UNIFORMS no bid no bid

Sublimated Game Jerseys no bid no bid

Size Youth X-Small, each: $0.00 $0.00 $49.95 $33.00 $44.45

total for 15: $0.00 $0.00 $749.25 $495.00 $666.75

Size Youth Small, each $0.00 $0.00 $49.95 $33.00 $44.45

total for 15: $0.00 $0.00 $749.25 $495.00 $666.75

Size Youth Medium, each: $0.00 $0.00 $49.95 $33.00 $44.45

total for 30: $0.00 $0.00 $1,498.50 $990.00 $1,333.50

Size Youth Large, each $0.00 $0.00 $49.95 $33.00 $44.45

total for 20 $0.00 $0.00 $999.00 $660.00 $889.00

Size for Youth X-Large, each: $0.00 $0.00 $49.95 $33.00 $44.45

total for 25 $0.00 $0.00 $1,248.75 $825.00 $1,111.25

Size Adult X-Small, each: $0.00 $0.00 $54.95 $33.00 $46.50

total for 25: $0.00 $0.00 $1,373.75 $825.00 $1,162.50

Size Adult Small, each $0.00 $0.00 $54.95 $36.00 $46.50

total for 45: $0.00 $0.00 $2,472.75 $1,620.00 $2,092.50

Size Adult Medium, each: $0.00 $0.00 $54.95 $36.00 $46.50

total for 50: $0.00 $0.00 $2,747.50 $1,800.00 $2,325.00

Size Adult Large, each $0.00 $0.00 $54.95 $36.00 $46.50

total for 45 $0.00 $0.00 $2,472.75 $1,620.00 $2,092.50

Game jersey, Manufacturer/style 

number bid: Performance Team Sports Riddell Permatek Limited Pro Look FB1YJ & FB1J

Sublimated Game Pants no bid

Size Youth X-Small, each: $0.00 $0.00 $49.95 $26.25 $43.95

Total for 10: $0.00 $0.00 $499.50 $262.50 $439.50

Size Youth Small, each: $0.00 $0.00 $49.95 $26.25 $43.95

Total for 40: $0.00 $0.00 $1,998.00 $1,050.00 $1,758.00

Size Youth Medium, each: $0.00 $0.00 $49.95 $26.25 $43.95

Total for 40: $0.00 $0.00 $1,998.00 $1,050.00 $1,758.00

Size Youth Large, each: $0.00 $0.00 $49.95 $26.25 $43.95

Total for 20: $0.00 $0.00 $999.00 $525.00 $879.00

Size Youth X-Large, each: $0.00 $0.00 $49.95 $26.25 $43.95
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID  TABULATION

Bid #:  E-19-16  Title:  Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 04/12/16

Bidder:

BSN Sports

P.O. Box 49

Jenkintown, PA  19046

Home Team Athletics

242 S. Wilmington Hwy.

Jacksonville, NC 28540

Matty's Sports, Inc.

7911 NW 72 Ave. Ste. 106

Miami, FL 33166

Riddell

669 Sugar Lane

Elyria, OH  44035-8225

Valley Athletics

11735 NE Sumner St.

Portland OR 97220

Total for 40: $0.00 $0.00 $1,998.00 $1,050.00 $1,758.00

Size Adult Small, each: $0.00 $0.00 $54.95 $29.25 $47.45

Total for 55: $0.00 $0.00 $3,022.25 $1,608.75 $2,609.75

Size Adult Medium, each: $0.00 $0.00 $54.95 $29.25 $47.45

Total for 35: $0.00 $0.00 $1,923.25 $1,023.75 $1,660.75

Size Adult Large, each: $0.00 $0.00 $54.95 $29.25 $47.45

Total for 30: $0.00 $0.00 $1,648.50 $877.50 $1,423.50

Manufacturer/style number bid: Matty's 1001 Cust Riddell Permatek Limited Pro Look FB1YP & FB1P1

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 1 $0.00 $0.00 $28,398.00 $16,777.50 $24,626.25

Group 1 delivery time a.r.o., no later 

than 07-25-16: 30 calendar days 30-60 calendar days 30 calendar days

GROUP 2 -FULLY INTEGRATED 

PRACTICE PANTS, Game On, or 

equal no bid

Youth X-Small size,  each: $0.00 $25.00 $13.95 $10.20 $14.00

Total for 125: $0.00 $3,125.00 $1,743.75 $1,275.00 $1,750.00

Youth Small size, each: $0.00 $25.00 $13.95 $10.20 $14.00

Total for 85: $0.00 $2,125.00 $1,185.75 $867.00 $1,190.00

Youth Medium size, each: $0.00 $25.00 $13.95 $10.20 $14.00

Total for 70: $0.00 $1,750.00 $976.50 $714.00 $980.00

Youth Large size, each: $0.00 $25.00 $13.95 $10.20 $14.00

Total for 55 : $0.00 $1,375.00 $767.25 $561.00 $770.00

Youth X-Large size, each: $0.00 $25.00 $13.95 $10.20 $14.00

Total for 55: $0.00 $1,375.00 $767.25 $561.00 $770.00

Adult X-Small size, each: $0.00 $25.00 $17.25 $11.70 $21.00

Total for 50: $0.00 $1,250.00 $862.50 $585.00 $1,050.00

Adult Small size, each: $0.00 $25.00 $17.25 $11.70 $21.00

Total for 30: $0.00 $750.00 $517.50 $351.00 $630.00

Adult Medium size, each: $0.00 $25.00 $17.25 $11.70 $21.00

Total for 50 $0.00 $1,250.00 $862.50 $585.00 $1,050.00

Adult Large size, each: $0.00 $25.00 $17.25 $11.70 $21.00
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID  TABULATION

Bid #:  E-19-16  Title:  Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 04/12/16

Bidder:

BSN Sports

P.O. Box 49

Jenkintown, PA  19046

Home Team Athletics

242 S. Wilmington Hwy.

Jacksonville, NC 28540

Matty's Sports, Inc.

7911 NW 72 Ave. Ste. 106

Miami, FL 33166

Riddell

669 Sugar Lane

Elyria, OH  44035-8225

Valley Athletics

11735 NE Sumner St.

Portland OR 97220

Total for 30 $0.00 $750.00 $517.50 $351.00 $630.00

Adult X-Large size, each: $0.00 $25.00 $17.25 $11.70 $21.00

Total for 50 : $0.00 $1,250.00 $862.50 $585.00 $1,050.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Champro #FPC Martin or Champro Riddell YPPW/PPW

Yth: A4NB6180; Adlt: 

Champro FPC

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 2 $0.00 $15,000.00 $9,063.00 $6,435.00 $9,870.00

  

Group 2 delivery time a.r.o., no later 

than 06-15-16: 10 calendar days 30 calendar days 15-30 calendar days

GROUP 3 - SHOULDER PADS

X-Small, as per specifications, each: $29.39 $32.00 $29.50 $26.50 $31.00

Total for 90: $2,645.10 $2,880.00 $2,655.00 $2,385.00 $2,790.00

Small,  as per specifications, each: $30.94 $32.00 $29.50 $26.50 $31.00

Total for 90: $2,784.60 $2,880.00 $2,655.00 $2,385.00 $2,790.00

Medium, as per specifications, each: $34.83 $32.00 $29.50 $26.50 $31.00

Total for 75: $2,612.25 $2,400.00 $2,212.50 $1,987.50 $2,325.00

Large, as per specifications, each: $35.75 $32.00 $29.50 $26.50 $31.00

Total for 45: $1,608.75 $1,440.00 $1,327.50 $1,192.50 $1,395.00

X-Large, as per specifications, each: $36.92 $32.00 $29.50 $26.50 $31.00

Total for 35: $1,292.20 $1,120.00 $1,032.50 $927.50 $1,085.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Gear Air Tech Jr 1377130 Champro Air Tech 3.3 Champro Scorpion Riddell Quest Youth Champro FSP5

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 3 $10,942.90 $10,720.00 $9,882.50 $8,877.50 $10,385.00

Group 3 delivery time a.r.o., no later 

than 06-15-16: 14 calendar days 10 calendar days 30 calendar days 15-30 calendar days 30 calendar days

GROUP 4 - FOOTBALL EQUIPMENT      
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID  TABULATION

Bid #:  E-19-16  Title:  Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 04/12/16

Bidder:

BSN Sports

P.O. Box 49

Jenkintown, PA  19046

Home Team Athletics

242 S. Wilmington Hwy.

Jacksonville, NC 28540

Matty's Sports, Inc.

7911 NW 72 Ave. Ste. 106

Miami, FL 33166

Riddell

669 Sugar Lane

Elyria, OH  44035-8225

Valley Athletics

11735 NE Sumner St.

Portland OR 97220
ITEM 1, HELMETS, Riddell 

Revolution Attack Youth Helmet, or 

equal no bid no bid

X-Small, each: $0.00 $95.00 $64.95 $62.00 $0.00

total for 95: $0.00 $9,025.00 $6,170.25 $5,890.00 $0.00

Small, each: $0.00 $95.00 $64.95 $62.00 $0.00

total for 85: $0.00 $8,075.00 $5,520.75 $5,270.00 $0.00

Medium, each: $0.00 $95.00 $64.95 $62.00 $0.00

total for 80: $0.00 $7,600.00 $5,196.00 $4,960.00 $0.00

Large, each: $0.00 $95.00 $64.95 $62.00 $0.00

total for 35: $0.00 $3,325.00 $2,273.25 $2,170.00 $0.00

X-Large, each: $0.00 $102.00 $64.95 $62.00 $0.00

total for 25: $0.00 $2,550.00 $1,623.75 $1,550.00 $0.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Shutt #798004XCC w/mask

TOTAL ITEM 1: $0.00 $30,575.00 $20,784.00 $19,840.00 $0.00

ITEM 2, FOOTBALLS

K2, each: $0.00 $19.22 $0.00 $24.00 $0.00

total for 80: $0.00 $1,537.60 $0.00 $1,920.00 $0.00

TDK, each: $0.00 $19.22 $0.00 $27.00 $0.00

total for 45: $0.00 $864.90 $0.00 $1,215.00 $0.00

TDY, each: $0.00 $19.22 $0.00 $27.50 $0.00

total for 45: $0.00 $864.90 $0.00 $1,237.50 $0.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Champro 500 performance Riddell 42335 42334 42333

TOTAL ITEM 2: $0.00 $3,267.40 $0.00 $4,372.50 $0.00

ITEM 3, JAW PADS no bid no bid

Small, each: $0.00 $3.38 $0.00 $1.40 $0.00

total for 125: $0.00 $422.50 $0.00 $175.00 $0.00
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID  TABULATION

Bid #:  E-19-16  Title:  Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 04/12/16

Bidder:

BSN Sports

P.O. Box 49

Jenkintown, PA  19046

Home Team Athletics

242 S. Wilmington Hwy.

Jacksonville, NC 28540

Matty's Sports, Inc.

7911 NW 72 Ave. Ste. 106

Miami, FL 33166

Riddell

669 Sugar Lane

Elyria, OH  44035-8225

Valley Athletics

11735 NE Sumner St.

Portland OR 97220

Medium, each: $0.00 $3.38 $0.00 $1.40 $0.00

total for 125: $0.00 $422.50 $0.00 $175.00 $0.00

Large, each: $0.00 $4.68 $0.00 $4.00 $0.00

total for 50: $0.00 $234.00 $0.00 $200.00 $0.00

X-Large, each: $0.00 $4.68 $0.00 $4.00 $0.00

total for 50: $0.00 $234.00 $0.00 $200.00 $0.00

Manufacturer/style number bid:

Athletic Specialties JPM, 

JPMS Riddell

TOTAL ITEM 3: $0.00 $1,313.00 $0.00 $750.00 $0.00

ITEM 4, CHIN STRAPS no bid no bid

Youth, high hook up, each: $0.00 $4.79 $0.00 $3.90 $0.00

Total for 200: $0.00 $958.00 $0.00 $780.00 $0.00

Youth, low hook up, each: $0.00 $4.79 $0.00 $3.90 $0.00

Total for 150: $0.00 $718.50 $0.00 $585.00 $0.00

Adult, low hook up, each: $0.00 $6.30 $0.00 $3.90 $0.00

Total for 100: $0.00 $630.00 $0.00 $390.00 $0.00

Manufacturer/style number bid:

Athletic Specialties YCS4, 

RCS4, BY59 Riddell 

TOTAL ITEM 4: $0.00 $2,306.50 $0.00 $1,755.00 $0.00

ITEM 5, KEYWAY HOOKS no bid no bid

1", each: $0.00 $0.32 $0.00 $0.30 $0.00

Total for 100: $0.00 $32.40 $0.00 $30.00 $0.00

1-1/2", each: $0.00 $0.38 $0.00 $0.35 $0.00

Total for 100: $0.00 $38.00 $0.00 $35.00 $0.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Athletic Specialties KS2 Riddell 1204 & 1207

TOTAL ITEM 5: $0.00 $70.40 $0.00 $65.00 $0.00
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID  TABULATION

Bid #:  E-19-16  Title:  Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 04/12/16

Bidder:

BSN Sports

P.O. Box 49

Jenkintown, PA  19046

Home Team Athletics

242 S. Wilmington Hwy.

Jacksonville, NC 28540

Matty's Sports, Inc.

7911 NW 72 Ave. Ste. 106

Miami, FL 33166

Riddell

669 Sugar Lane

Elyria, OH  44035-8225

Valley Athletics

11735 NE Sumner St.

Portland OR 97220

 

ITEM 6, "T" HOOKS no bid no bid

1", each: $0.00 $0.45 $0.00 $0.30 $0.00

Total for 250: $0.00 $112.50 $0.00 $75.00 $0.00

1-1/2", each: $0.00 $0.48 $0.00 $0.35 $0.00

Total for 250: $0.00 $120.00 $0.00 $87.50 $0.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Athletic Specialties Riddell 1208 & 1219

TOTAL ITEM 6: $0.00 $232.50 $0.00 $162.50 $0.00

ITEM 7, TRAINER TAPE no bid no bid

1", Black, per box: $0.00 $36.00 $0.00 $54.00 $0.00

Total for 6: $0.00 $216.00 $0.00 $324.00 $0.00

1-1/2", White, per box: $0.00 $18.99 $0.00 $47.00 $0.00

Total for 4: $0.00 $75.96 $0.00 $188.00 $0.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Mueller M Tape Riddell 60202

TOTAL ITEM 7: $0.00 $291.96 $0.00 $512.00 $0.00

ITEM 8, ELASTIC STRAP no bid

no bid

1", Black, per roll: $0.00 $29.21 $0.00 $30.00 $0.00

Total for 8: $0.00 $233.68 $0.00 $240.00 $0.00

1-1/2", Black, per roll: $0.00 $32.40 $0.00 $35.00 $0.00

Total for 8: $0.00 $259.20 $0.00 $280.00 $0.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Athletic Specialties Riddell BLES10 & BLES15

TOTAL ITEM 8: $0.00 $492.88 $0.00 $520.00 $0.00

ITEM 9, MISCELLANEOUS no bid no bid
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID  TABULATION

Bid #:  E-19-16  Title:  Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 04/12/16

Bidder:

BSN Sports

P.O. Box 49

Jenkintown, PA  19046

Home Team Athletics

242 S. Wilmington Hwy.

Jacksonville, NC 28540

Matty's Sports, Inc.

7911 NW 72 Ave. Ste. 106

Miami, FL 33166

Riddell

669 Sugar Lane

Elyria, OH  44035-8225

Valley Athletics

11735 NE Sumner St.

Portland OR 97220

a. Belts, black, each: $0.00 $1.50 $0.00 $0.80 $0.00

Total for 120 $0.00 $180.00 $0.00 $96.00 $0.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Champro FWB Riddell WB52

b. Mouth Pieces, each: $0.00 $0.75 $0.00 $0.39 $0.00

Total for 1000: $0.00 $750.00 $0.00 $390.00 $0.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Vettex MG2 Model 90 Riddell 45791

c. Whistles, each: $0.00 $0.65 $0.00 $1.40 $0.00

Total for 275: $0.00 $178.75 $0.00 $385.00 $0.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Champion #601 Ath. Specialties PLC

d. Lanyards, each: $0.00 $0.65 $0.00 $0.50 $0.00

Total for 275: $0.00 $178.75 $0.00 $137.50 $0.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Champion #120 Ath. Spec. LANR

e. Shoulder Pad Laces, each: $0.00 $0.45 $0.00 $0.35 $0.00

Total for 200: $0.00 $90.00 $0.00 $70.00 $0.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Athletic Specialties SPBE Ath. Specialtes SPBE

f. Pylon Markers, each: $0.00 $11.24 $0.00 $6.00 $0.00

Total for 12: $0.00 $134.85 $0.00 $72.00 $0.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Champion #FPYL

Riddell RWAP (sold insets 

of 4)

g.Yard Markers, per set: $0.00 $164.95 $0.00 $172.00 $0.00

Total for 2: $0.00 $329.90 $0.00 $344.00 $0.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Champion #A104 Riddell RCCSLM
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID  TABULATION

Bid #:  E-19-16  Title:  Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 04/12/16

Bidder:

BSN Sports

P.O. Box 49

Jenkintown, PA  19046

Home Team Athletics

242 S. Wilmington Hwy.

Jacksonville, NC 28540

Matty's Sports, Inc.

7911 NW 72 Ave. Ste. 106

Miami, FL 33166

Riddell

669 Sugar Lane

Elyria, OH  44035-8225

Valley Athletics

11735 NE Sumner St.

Portland OR 97220

h. Down Markers, per set: $0.00 $325.00 $0.00 $118.00 $0.00

Total for 3: $0.00 $975.00 $0.00 $354.00 $0.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Champro A103 Riddell RFDMRC

i. Kick-Off Tees, each: $0.00 $3.50 $0.00 $2.80 $0.00

Total for 36: $0.00 $126.00 $0.00 $100.80 $0.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Champro A1000 Riddell 27541

j. Extra Point Tees, each: $0.00 $3.50 $0.00 $2.80 $0.00

Total for 30: $0.00 $105.00 $0.00 $84.00 $0.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Champro A101 Riddell 27540

k. Helmet Hardware: FGRS (small) set: $0.00 $4.20 $0.00 $3.10 $0.00

Total for 50: $0.00 $210.00 $0.00 $155.00 $0.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Athletic Specialties Athletic Specialties FGRS

l. Helmet Hardware: FGAG (large), set: $0.00 $4.20 $0.00 $3.10 $0.00

Total for 50: $0.00 $210.00 $0.00 $155.00 $0.00

Manufacturer/style number bid: Athletic Specialties Athletic Specialties FGAG

TOTAL ITEM 9 (a-l): $0.00 $3,468.25 $0.00 $2,343.30 $0.00

GRAND TOTAL GROUP 4 (ITEMS 1-

9) $0.00 $42,017.89

Incomplete bid for Group, 

cannot be considered per 

Section I - 

Specifications/Special 

Conditions, C. Bid 

Items/Grouping $30,320.30 $0.00

Group 4 delivery time a.r.o., no later 

than 06-15-16: 10 calendar days 30 calendar days 15-30 calendar days
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID  TABULATION

Bid #:  E-19-16  Title:  Football Uniforms and Equipment

Date 04/12/16

Bidder:

BSN Sports

P.O. Box 49

Jenkintown, PA  19046

Home Team Athletics

242 S. Wilmington Hwy.

Jacksonville, NC 28540

Matty's Sports, Inc.

7911 NW 72 Ave. Ste. 106

Miami, FL 33166

Riddell

669 Sugar Lane

Elyria, OH  44035-8225

Valley Athletics

11735 NE Sumner St.

Portland OR 97220

Notes:

Group 4-Items 1, 4, & 5 

corrected for tabulation. 

Group 2 Grand Total was 

corrected for tabulation. 

Group 4 was a non-

responsive bid.

Group 4 Grand Total was 

corrected for tabulation  
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